

SHERRARD & ROE

Tennessee Marriage Equality Effort
Re: Constitutional Challenge

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
08/05/13	William L. Harbison	Emails; telephone conference call with A. Rubenfeld.	1.00
08/06/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Review complaints; emails with A. Rubenfeld; emails with William L. Harbison.	0.80
08/06/13	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference with A. Rubenfeld; William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer conference; review research and pleadings; review emails.	1.00
08/07/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/William L. Harbison conference; emails re: same; email with A. Rubenfeld.	1.00
08/07/13	William L. Harbison	Emails; William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer conference.	1.00
08/08/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Two conference calls; legal research; Phillip F. Cramer/William L. Harbison conference.	5.10
08/08/13	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference call; William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer conference.	1.50
08/13/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on legal research for complaint and case.	0.80
08/14/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Legal research; multiple conference calls and conferences with counsel re: case and strategy; work on case prep.	5.30
08/14/13	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer conference; research; telephone conferences regarding case strategy.	4.00
08/14/13	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conferences; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference call with other counsel	2.30
08/14/13	John L. Farringer	Review public research; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: strategy and standing; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same.	0.60
08/15/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; legal research; conference call with co- counsel.	1.80
08/15/13	J. Scott Hickman	Conference call; legal research; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference.	1.80
08/15/13	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference call with counsel; research.	1.50
08/15/13	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: call yesterday; prepare for review of legislative history.	0.30
08/16/13	John L. Farringer	Review legislative history.	0.60

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
08/19/13	J. Scott Hickman	Legal research re: 6th Circuit intimate association cases.	1.70
08/20/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Review case law	0.50
08/21/13	J. Scott Hickman	Further legal research.	2.00
08/22/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Review legislative history; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference.	2.60
08/22/13	John L. Farringer	Review news article; correspondence re: same; review tapes for legislative history and committee discussions; correspondence re: status; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference.	1.70
08/22/13	J. Scott Hickman	Legal research re: 6th Circuit Intimate Assoc. cases; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference .	2.50
08/23/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Conference call with counsel; multiple emails with same.	0.80
08/23/13	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference; research.	1.50
08/23/13	J. Scott Hickman	Conference call and internal conferences.	0.90
08/26/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with group re: legislative history; Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference.	0.30
08/26/13	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same and strategy.	0.20
08/28/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Review legislative history; conference call with counsel.	3.10
08/28/13	J. Scott Hickman	Legal research; draft memo re: 6th Circuit case.	2.30
08/28/13	John L. Farringer	Review legislative history; telephone conference with team; review research and drafts.	0.70
08/30/13	John L. Farringer	Review multiple correspondence; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: status and strategy; review correspondence.	0.40
08/30/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Review email re: potential plaintiffs; review legislative history; emails with counsel; Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference.	0.50
09/02/13	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence and documents from last week; review transcripts of legislative history; outline potential discussion topics.	1.00
09/03/13	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: plaintiff profile; review profiles.	0.30
09/03/13	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with A. Orr.	0.30
09/06/13	J. Scott Hickman	Conference call with non-S&R counsel.	0.50
09/09/13	John L. Farringer	Review draft letter to UT re: benefits; correspondence re: same.	0.30
09/10/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: case developments, including proper defendants.	0.40

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
09/10/13	John L. Farringer	Review AG opinions and multiple correspondence re: same.	0.30
09/10/13	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with counsel re: TN Attorney General's opinion; review same.	0.30
09/13/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: conference call.	0.10
09/13/13	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: conference call.	0.10
09/16/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Conference call; follow-up emails.	0.70
09/16/13	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence; telephone conference with team re: strategy.	0.50
09/17/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Legal research and emails re: same.	0.80
09/17/13	John L. Farringer	Correspondence and research re: rules on using initials or pseudonym for plaintiffs.	0.30
09/18/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Research on proper defendants.	0.40
09/18/13	John L. Farringer	Review article re: DOL announcement; correspondence re: same.	0.20
09/19/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on legal research re: defendants internal conference.	0.70
09/19/13	John L. Farringer	Review multiple correspondence re: potential plaintiffs; conference re same.	0.30
09/19/13	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference re: status of complaint.	0.30
09/20/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Complete research re: defendants; email to group.	0.50
09/22/13	John L. Farringer	Review multiple correspondence re: deed, register and defendants; correspondence re: same.	0.30
09/23/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Prepare for conference call; conference call with counsel.	1.50
09/23/13	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence re: potential plaintiffs; review article and comments and correspondence re: same; telephone conference with team; review legislative history tapes and summary; listen to legislative history.	3.10
09/23/13	J. Scott Hickman	Conference call with co-counsel and various emails.	2.30
09/24/13	John L. Farringer	Work on legislative history review and transcriptions.	0.20
09/25/13	William L. Harbison	Emails; telephone conference with counsel; research.	2.10
09/25/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Review legislative history; emails with counsel; Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference.	0.40
09/25/13	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: transcripts; work on transcriptions; correspondence with team re: same.	0.60
09/26/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Telephone conference re: Ins. Defendants and potential theories.	0.40
09/27/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails with counsel.	0.20

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
09/29/13	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: draft complaint, plaintiffs, recording deed and legislative history.	0.40
09/30/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails re: preparing complaint.	0.20
10/01/13	J. Scott Hickman	Legal research and draft complaint sections re: deprivations under Tennessee law.	2.20
10/01/13	William L. Harbison	Emails; review research.	1.00
10/01/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails with group.	0.20
10/01/13	John L. Farringer	Review letter to register of deeds and multiple correspondence re: same.	0.30
10/02/13	Carla L. Lovell	Conference with William L. Harbison re: marriage equality case re: inheritance laws and harms caused by non-recognition	0.20
10/02/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails; conference call with counsel.	1.80
10/02/13	J. Scott Hickman	Draft insert to complaint re: Tennessee law and legal research re: same.	2.40
10/02/13	John L. Farringer	Review letter response re: deed; multiple correspondence re: same and press release; internal conferences.	0.60
10/03/13	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with C. Stoll re: complaint.	0.20
10/03/13	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: contacting commissioner of insurance office.	0.30
10/04/13	J. Scott Hickman	Revise insert for complaint and email C. Stoll re: same.	0.40
10/07/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails ; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference.	0.30
10/07/13	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference.	0.30
10/07/13	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with A. Orr; status emails re: complaint; Conference with William L. Harbison and Phillip F. Cramer.	0.60
10/08/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Begin review of complaint; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails with counsel.	0.40
10/08/13	John L. Farringer	Review draft complaint; telephone conference with team.	1.00
10/08/13	J. Scott Hickman	Review complaint and conference call; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference.	1.80
10/09/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on complaint; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer conference; legal research.	4.00
10/09/13	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference.	0.50
10/09/13	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference re: complaint and case status; follow up on same	0.70

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
10/09/13	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: complaint and strategy; multiple correspondence re: defendants and pleadings.	0.70
10/10/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Legal and public records research; emails re: standing.	1.40
10/10/13	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference; review complaint	1.00
10/10/13	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: strategy on plaintiffs; review draft complaint and correspondence re: same; work on complaint.	1.40
10/11/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Telephone conference with A. Orr and John L. Farringer; multiple follow up emails with same.	0.50
10/11/13	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: call; telephone conference re: standing issue.	0.20
10/13/13	J. Scott Hickman	Revise complaint.	2.60
10/14/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Revise complaint; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference.	1.50
10/14/13	John L. Farringer	Review amendments to complaint and correspondence re: same.	0.20
10/14/13	J. Scott Hickman	Revise complaint and circulate; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference.	1.60
10/15/13	William L. Harbison	Review emails; participate in telephone conference call; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman.	1.30
10/15/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Conference call; review and work on pro hac vice papers and engagement letter.	2.40
10/15/13	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: complaint, engagement and pro hac vice motions.	0.30
10/15/13	J. Scott Hickman	Conference call.	1.00
10/16/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Conference call with counsel; emails with same.	0.80
10/16/13	John L. Farringer	Review draft email to plaintiffs; conference and telephone conference with team re: finalizing complaint.	2.00
10/16/13	J. Scott Hickman	Various conferences re: draft complaint; work on same; conference call re: complaint.	3.00
10/16/13	William L. Harbison	Research and review complaint; emails.	2.00
10/17/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails with counsel.	0.20
10/17/13	John L. Farringer	Review engagement letter; correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: edits and filing logistics.	0.30
10/17/13	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with A. Orr and status emails with co-counsel; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference.	0.40
10/17/13	William L. Harbison	Review emails.	0.30

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
10/18/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails and work on complaint; internal conferences re complaint.	0.50
10/18/13	John L. Farringer	Work on civil cover sheet; conferences and correspondence re: edits to same; edits to complaint and engagement letter; review press release and correspondence re: edits to complaint	0.60
10/18/13	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conferences; various calls re: complaint; revise same.	0.80
10/19/13	William L. Harbison	Work through and address numerous emails, including attachments.	1.50
10/20/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails; review and revise complaint; review ancillary documents; meeting with co-counsel.	2.70
10/20/13	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: edits and meeting; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: edits and filing; final review of complaint	0.80
10/20/13	William L. Harbison	Emails; meet with clients; meet with counsel; finalize complaint.	4.50
10/21/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Revise complaint; meeting with counsel; file complaint; meeting re: strategy and next steps.	4.90
10/21/13	William L. Harbison	Meet with counsel and clients; finalize and file complaint; emails.	6.00
10/21/13	John L. Farringer	Multiple conferences with team and final edits to complaint for filing; correspondence re: news.	0.90
10/21/13	J. Scott Hickman	Finalize Complaint for filing; meet with all counsel re: filing of answer; conferences with S. Minter re: final changes to Complaint; various emails and telephone conferences among counsel re: post-filing matters.	6.20
10/22/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Conference call with counsel; numerous emails; work on PI/next steps.	2.70
10/22/13	William L. Harbison	Conference call; emails; meet with B. Cooper.	3.00
10/22/13	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: William L. Harbison meeting with B. Cooper and immigration issue.	0.20
10/22/13	J. Scott Hickman	Numerous emails/telephone conferences among counsel re: Complaint/receipt of filings from Court, communications with Attorney General's office and service issues.	1.80
10/23/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails with counsel.	0.30
10/23/13	John L. Farringer	Review notice of setting initial case management conference; correspondence re: same.	0.20

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
10/24/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails re: case; discussion of strategy.	0.60
10/24/13	William L. Harbison	Emails; review court filings.	0.30
10/28/13	J. Scott Hickman	File motion to appear pro hac vice for R. Lambert.	0.30
10/30/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: PI papers.	0.10
10/30/13	J. Scott Hickman	Review and address emails re: potential motion for preliminary injunction.	0.30
10/31/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: PI.	0.10
10/31/13	John L. Farringer	Review notice of appearance for defendants; correspondence re: same.	0.20
10/31/13	J. Scott Hickman	Prepare and send correspondence to M. Campbell.	0.20
11/05/13	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference with counsel.	1.00
11/05/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails; revise declaration; conference call with counsel; internal conference.	3.20
11/05/13	J. Scott Hickman	Conference call with all counsel re: status; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conferences.	1.20
11/06/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: PI.	0.20
11/07/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Draft declaration for M. Mansell.	1.90
11/08/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Revise PI legal section of brief; emails & conference with counsel.	1.50
11/08/13	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: affidavits and motion; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same.	0.30
11/11/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel; review legal section.	0.40
11/11/13	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence and draft arguments for injunction hearing.	0.20
11/12/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel and review brief section.	0.30
11/12/13	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: extension of time for AG's Answer.	0.20
11/12/13	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with M. Campbell; telephone conference with co-counsel re: extension request; email M. Campbell re: same.	0.60
11/13/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Telephone conference with S. Minter; emails with same; legal research; Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference.	0.50
11/13/13	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: historical statutes and revised declarations; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same; review draft declarations; correspondence re: same.	0.70
11/14/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel; review and revise legal section of brief.	1.80
11/14/13	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: declarations and draft brief; review edits from multiple co-counsel and correspondence re: same.	0.50

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
11/15/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on brief section; revise documents; numerous emails.	2.60
11/15/13	William L. Harbison	Emails; review arguments for brief.	1.60
11/15/13	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence re: edits to documents; review ancillary documents describing filing; multiple correspondence re: upcoming filing.	0.60
11/15/13	J. Scott Hickman	Review answer; telephone conference with M. Campbell re: page limit motion; emails with co-counsel re: preliminary injunction motion and answer.	1.80
11/17/13	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: latest versions of filings and citing legislative history; review answer filed by state; correspondence re: answer and legislative history.	0.40
11/18/13	Amy R. Mohan	Cite checked brief in support of motion for preliminary injunction.	2.70
11/18/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on brief, motion and other papers; conference call with counsel.	7.10
11/18/13	John L. Farringer	Work on memorandum of law; multiple correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; draft motion for preliminary injunction; work on all filings and correspondence re: same; multiple conferences re: same; review correspondence and final edits.	4.30
11/18/13	J. Scott Hickman	Work on motion for preliminary injunction and related documents, numerous conferences/emails with co-counsel re: same.	7.50
11/18/13	William L. Harbison	Work on and review preliminary injunction and related documents; meet with counsel.	1.50
11/19/13	Amy R. Mohan	Revise Table of Authorities, Brief.	2.50
11/19/13	John L. Farringer	Review multiple correspondence and edits to motion and memorandum; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; work on motion; correspondence re: edits to motion and filing; work on declarations and notice of filing; finalize all documents for filing; review filings and press release.	2.00
11/19/13	J. Scott Hickman	Finalize and file motion and memorandum for preliminary injunction and related documents; conferences re same.	7.00
11/19/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on finalizing brief and papers; numerous emails with co- counsel.	2.40
11/20/13	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference with clients re: recent motion and press inquiries; numerous emails with	1.70

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
		counsel re: status of motion and next steps; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference re: motion.	
11/20/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Meeting with plaintiffs; respond to questions re: filings; emails with counsel.	2.80
11/20/13	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence; multiple correspondence re: clients and press; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same; review articles.	0.70
11/21/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: PI filings.	0.30
11/23/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Review research; email with counsel.	0.20
11/25/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: oral arguments and reply brief.	0.60
11/25/13	William L. Harbison	Emails with counsel re: next steps and recent filings.	0.50
11/25/13	J. Scott Hickman	Emails re: recent filings with NCLR team.	0.20
11/26/13	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence re: oral argument; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	0.20
12/01/13	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence and public reports.	0.30
12/05/13	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with Asaf Orr re: conference call; status emails with all co-counsel; telephone conference with M. Campbell re: State's motion to exceed page limit.	0.50
12/05/13	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: answer and telephone call.	0.10
12/06/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: PI response.	0.10
12/06/13	J. Scott Hickman	Review State's response to Preliminary Injunction Motion.	0.40
12/08/13	John L. Farringer	Review response and affidavit filed by state and correspondence re: same.	0.50
12/09/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Review response brief for purposes of reply; review proposed amicus brief.	1.20
12/09/13	John L. Farringer	Review filings; correspondence with team re: same.	0.60
12/10/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Prepare for conference call; conference call with counsel; work on case law.	2.30
12/10/13	William L. Harbison	Emails; telephone conference; review briefs.	1.40
12/10/13	John L. Farringer	Share thoughts and insights with Phillip F. Cramer to providing during conference call re: response to motion and call this afternoon.	0.20
12/10/13	J. Scott Hickman	Conference call with all counsel; emails with all counsel.	1.20
12/11/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on reply brief; legal research; internal conferences re reply brief.	3.20
12/11/13	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence re: topics and tasks; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer	0.40

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
12/11/13	J. Scott Hickman	conference re: tasks for reply; correspondence re: division of labor. Draft motion re: reply brief; telephone conference with M. Campbell re: same; conference re: brief sections/responsibility and emails re: same with C. Stoll and Phillip F. Cramer.	0.90
12/12/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on PI reply; legal research.	3.60
12/13/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on reply brief.	4.10
12/15/13	John L. Farringer	Work on irreparable harm section.	1.90
12/16/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Review and revise irreparable injury section; review and revise caption rule section.	2.00
12/16/13	J. Scott Hickman	Research and draft reply brief section regarding Section 113(d).	4.60
12/16/13	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference; work on irreparable harm insert.	0.30
12/17/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on PI reply; emails with counsel Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference.	0.30
12/17/13	J. Scott Hickman	Revise brief; review other drafts; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference; email C. Stoll.	1.20
12/17/13	John L. Farringer	Work on irreparable harm insert; correspondence re: same.	0.50
12/18/13	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer/William L. Harbison conference re: reply brief status.	0.30
12/18/13	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: draft reply and filing procedure.	0.20
12/18/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on reply; email and conference with counsel.	0.20
12/19/13	J. Scott Hickman	Internal conferences and emails with all counsel re: reply brief.	0.60
12/19/13	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: reply, edits and filing.	0.40
12/20/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on reply brief; numerous calls and emails re: reply brief.	3.20
12/20/13	Amy R. Mohan	Review reply brief to verify appendix of cases.	0.30
12/20/13	John L. Farringer	Work on reply brief; multiple correspondence re: same.	0.40
12/20/13	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference with S. Minter; William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; review brief.	1.00
12/20/13	J. Scott Hickman	Numerous conferences, emails and telephone conferences with co-counsel re: reply brief; revise, edit and file same.	7.50
12/23/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Review new decisions.	0.30
12/23/13	J. Scott Hickman	Draft notice of filing of supplemental authority; telephone conference with S. Minter re: same; emails with co-counsel.	1.40

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
12/23/13	John L. Farringer	Analyze Utah and New Mexico opinions.	0.80
12/24/13	J. Scott Hickman	Prepare and file notice of supplemental authority; numerous telephone conferences and emails with S. Minter and other counsel.	3.30
12/24/13	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails re: notice; review notice of supplemental filing.	0.60
12/24/13	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence re: supplemental filing; review notice of filing and correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman telephone conference re: filing; multiple correspondence re: same.	0.40
12/30/13	J. Scott Hickman	Review motion to consolidate and related filings; emails with co- counsel re: same.	1.20
01/02/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails with same; emails with John L. Farringer and S. Minter.	0.30
01/02/14	John L. Farringer	Review Sevier filings; telephone conference with T. Wiseman re: same; correspondence with T. Wiseman re: same.	1.40
01/02/14	J. Scott Hickman	Email S. Minter re: case management conference; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same; review motion to consolidate; telephone conference with T. Wiseman re: same; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference.	0.80
01/03/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails with same and S. Minter.	0.20
01/03/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: Sevier filings and AG's notice; review FMLA article re: damages.	0.20
01/03/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review FMLA article and email co-counsel re: additional damage claims; internal conferences re same.	0.30
01/07/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: case management conference.	0.40
01/08/14	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails; telephone conferences with attorney general's office.	1.00
01/08/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with C. Stoll, S. Minter, and D. Codell re: initial case management order; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference re: case management order; review Idaho case management form.	0.90
01/09/14	William L. Harbison	Telephone conferences re: management order; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference.	1.00
01/09/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conferences.	0.40

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
01/09/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with Attorney General's office re: case management order; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer conferences with co-counsel re:same and draft initial case management order.	2.60
01/10/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Order from court; numerous emails re: initial case management order drafting and preparation.	0.60
01/10/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with Shannon Minter, David Codell, and Chris Stoll re: ICM conference/order; telephone conference with M. Campbell re: case management order; numerous telephone conferences with co-counsel re: order; revise proposed order; telephone conference with Judge Trauger's office re: case management conference; emails with co-counsel re: case management conference status.	4.20
01/10/14	John L. Farringer	Review draft initial case management order and correspondence re: same.	0.20
01/13/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review article; emails with counsel re: same; review order.	0.40
01/15/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review Oklahoma decisions; emails re: same.	0.20
01/15/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review Oklahoma opinion; emails with co-counsel re: same.	0.60
01/22/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails with counsel.	0.20
01/22/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference; telephone conference with S. Minter re: effect of potential opinion; potential stay motion and related issues.	0.80
01/24/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with J. Scott Hickman and co-counsel; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference.	0.30
01/24/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference; telephone conference with S. Minter re: potential issues post-opinion.	0.80
01/26/14	John L. Farringer	Review draft press response; correspondence re: same.	0.20
01/29/14	John L. Farringer	Review motion to intervene and correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman telephone conference re: same; review filings.	0.80
01/29/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review motion to intervene; telephone conference with M. Campbell re: same; emails with co-counsel re: same; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference; review local rules re: response.	1.40

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
01/30/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review brief; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: response.	0.80
01/31/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review order; emails with co-counsel.	0.40
01/31/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review order and emails with co-counsel re: same.	0.30
02/04/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review draft press response.	0.20
02/05/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; review docket entry from Court.	0.40
02/06/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference.	0.20
02/06/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter re: timing of opinion/potential steps; conference with Phillip F. Cramer re same.	0.30
02/07/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails with counsel.	0.20
02/12/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review Kentucky opinion; emails with counsel; revise notice of filing.	1.60
02/12/14	John L. Farringer	Review Kentucky decision and multiple correspondence re: same; review draft notice for court and correspondence re: same.	0.80
02/12/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with D. Codell; review notice of filing, etc.	0.50
02/13/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel; Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference.	0.40
02/13/14	William L. Harbison	Emails; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference.	0.50
02/13/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: Kentucky opinion and strategy; correspondence re: new Alabama case; review articles and correspondence re: cases in other states.	0.40
02/14/14	John L. Farringer	Review Virginia opinion; correspondence re: same.	0.20
02/14/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: filing; review notice.	0.40
02/14/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter re: filing of supplemental notice, status of motion.	0.40
02/21/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: state and PI motion.	0.10
02/21/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference re: converting motion and strategy.	0.10
02/21/14	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with S. Minter re: potential summary judgment motion; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: same.	0.40
02/24/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference.	0.10
02/26/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: supplemental filing; Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference.	0.30

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
02/26/14	William L. Harbison	Emails; review court filings and new case rulings.	1.00
02/26/14	John L. Farringer	Review motion to intervene from S. Martin; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer	0.80
02/26/14	J. Scott Hickman	conference re: same; multiple correspondence re: Texas decision and filing; review notice of filing and multiple correspondence re: same.	0.80
02/27/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review motion to intervene; emails with co-counsel re: Texas ruling.	0.90
02/27/14	John L. Farringer	Review Texas opinion; review rules and email re: L.R. motion to ascertain status; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference.	0.30
02/27/14	J. Scott Hickman	Correspondence re: strategy on motion to ascertain status and filing notice.	0.80
02/28/14	Phillip F. Cramer	J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: potential TRO/motion to ascertain status.	0.10
03/03/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel.	0.80
03/03/14	J. Scott Hickman	Conference call with counsel; telephone conference with J. Scott Hickman; review rules re: voluntary dismissal.	1.20
03/04/14	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference with S. Minter; conference call re: potential dismissal of some claims/plaintiffs; email M. Campbell.	0.50
03/04/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel and review attachments.	0.50
03/04/14	John L. Farringer	Emails re: voluntary dismissal; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conferences; emails with co-counsel.	0.20
03/04/14	J. Scott Hickman	Correspondence re: Kentucky appeal and Knoxville press.	0.70
03/05/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with M. Campbell; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference; emails with co-counsel re: status of potential dismissal of certain parties.	0.40
03/05/14	Phillip F. Cramer	J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: status of motions; prepare follow up.	0.20
03/05/14	John L. Farringer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference; emails with same.	0.10
03/06/14	J. Scott Hickman	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: responding to motion to intervene.	0.80
03/06/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Telephone conference with M. Campbell; emails with co-counsel; draft stipulation of dismissal; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference.	0.30
		Review notice of dismissal; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails with co- counsel.	

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
03/07/14	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with M. Campbell; revise stipulation; emails with co- counsel.	0.60
03/09/14	J. Scott Hickman	Draft response to motion to intervene.	0.70
03/10/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review and revise draft filings; multiple emails with co-counsel.	0.50
03/10/14	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails.	1.00
03/10/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference; review draft response to motion and emails among counsel re: stipulation of dismissal; file stipulation of dismissal	0.80
03/10/14	John L. Farringer	Review and comment on draft response to motion to intervene; review and comment on stipulation of dismissal; multiple correspondence; review motion to ascertain status; multiple correspondence re: same.	0.70
03/11/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review filings and numerous emails with counsel.	0.40
03/11/14	John L. Farringer	Review new versions of motion to ascertain status and response to motion to intervene; multiple correspondence re: same.	0.40
03/11/14	William L. Harbison	Review motion to ascertain status; emails and conference re same.	0.60
03/11/14	J. Scott Hickman	Various conferences with co-counsel re: motion to ascertain status and response to motion to intervene; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference re: same; file motion and response.	1.30
03/12/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review order; emails with co-counsel.	0.20
03/12/14	John L. Farringer	Review order granting motion to ascertain status; multiple correspondence re: same; review Wisconsin order and correspondence re: same.	0.30
03/12/14	William L. Harbison	Review emails and court ruling; telephone conferences regarding same.	1.60
03/14/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review opinion; review orders; multiple emails.	1.20
03/14/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review order on preliminary injunction and related documents; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference re: same; emails with co-counsel.	0.80
03/14/14	John L. Farringer	Review memorandum and order granting preliminary injunction; multiple correspondence re: same; review media reports re: same.	1.10
03/16/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: next steps and conference call.	0.20
03/17/14	William L. Harbison	Prepare for and attend telephone conference regarding next steps.	2.00

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
03/17/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails ; review documents.	0.50
03/17/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: option and strategy on next steps; correspondence re: call.	1.70
03/17/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference; conference call with co-counsel re: granting of preliminary injunction motion, expectation of response from Attorney General's office and next steps; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference.	1.70
03/18/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review stay motion and related documents; telephone conference with S. Minter; emails with co-counsel re: motion to stay and related matters.	1.80
03/18/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review response; emails with counsel.	0.40
03/18/14	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence; correspondence with S. Jesty; review motion and appeal from state; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; multiple correspondence re: same; review and edit draft response brief; correspondence re: same.	1.40
03/18/14	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference; review pleadings; emails.	1.50
03/19/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review and revise response to motion to stay; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: same; telephone conference with S. Minter re: same; emails with C. Stoll re: same; file response to motion to stay.	2.60
03/19/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel; review response papers.	0.50
03/19/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: edits to brief and media reports; review new versions of brief; correspondence re: comments and edits for brief; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman telephone conference with S. Minter; multiple correspondence re: final versions; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	1.60
03/19/14	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference; review emails and draft response to Motion to Stay.	1.30
03/20/14	J. Scott Hickman	Various emails with co-counsel re: Kentucky ruling and pending stay motion; review order re: stay motion; various emails re: expected 6th Circuit motion to stay; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference.	1.10
03/20/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: stay in Kentucky case and possible supplemental	0.50

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
		filings; review order denying stay; multiple correspondence re: same as Sixth Circuit appearance.	
03/20/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails; review order.	0.50
03/20/14	William L. Harbison	Emails and conference; read court order.	1.00
03/21/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails with counsel; emails re: Sixth Circuit; review Michigan decisions.	0.60
03/22/14	John L. Farringer	Review documents from Michigan case; multiple correspondence re: same and stay.	0.30
03/24/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conferences; review rules re: stay; file appearance; emails re: next steps.	0.60
03/24/14	William L. Harbison	Review emails; William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference.	0.60
03/24/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: articles, mediation and letter; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: strategy.	0.40
03/24/14	J. Scott Hickman	Conference with co-counsel re: potential 6th Circuit mediation; telephone conference with S. Minter and D. Codell re: same.	1.20
03/25/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Draft letter; telephone conferences re: stay; research re: stay motion.	3.30
03/25/14	William L. Harbison	Emails; William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference.	1.00
03/25/14	J. Scott Hickman	Various conferences; telephone conference with S. Minter; review State's motion for stay; telephone conference with M. Campbell.	1.20
03/25/14	John L. Farringer	Review motion to stay; multiple correspondence re: same, case manager and briefing schedule; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same; review draft settlement letter; correspondence re: Michigan stay; review Michigan opinion.	1.30
03/26/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with team; revise letter; discussion re: mediation.	1.00
03/26/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with J. Collier at 6th Circuit; telephone conference with S. Minter; emails with co-counsel re: case status; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference re: potential mediation.	1.10
03/26/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: case manager call; response to motion and letter; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: letter.	0.50
03/27/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: response and letter.	0.20

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
03/27/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: letter and strategy.	0.20
03/28/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conferences; emails with co-counsel re: birth certificate issues.	0.80
03/28/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails re: birth certificate; begin work revisions to response to motion to stay.	0.60
03/28/14	William L. Harbison	Emails; William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conferences; telephone conference with J. Lambert.	1.50
03/28/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: birth certificate issue; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: same; multiple correspondence re: same and updates; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	0.70
03/30/14	John L. Farringer	Review and edit brief opposing stay on appeal; correspondence re: same.	0.50
03/31/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Revise response to motion to stay; emails with counsel.	0.90
03/31/14	William L. Harbison	Review and edit brief and emails.	1.00
03/31/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review and edit draft response in opposition to stay; telephone conference with M. Campbell; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference.	1.30
04/01/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter.	0.40
04/01/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: response; multiple correspondence re: same, other cases and health insurance; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman correspondence re: insurance issue.	0.40
04/02/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review declaration; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference.	0.50
04/02/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference re: 6th Circuit mediation and declarations; telephone conference with C. Stoll.	1.20
04/02/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: insurance issue; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: mediation at Sixth Circuit and correspondence re: same; review corporate disclosure statement from Defendants; review draft affidavit; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; review corporate disclosure statement filed by Plaintiff.	1.10
04/03/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: declaration and response.	0.10

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
04/03/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conferences re: declarations; emails with C. Stoll re: same.	0.60
04/03/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: affidavit and Sixth Circuit rules; review Sixth Circuit rules; review new version of affidavit; correspondence re: same.	0.40
04/04/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: finalizing response; emails re: health insurance.	0.20
04/04/14	J. Scott Hickman	Numerous emails with C. Stoll re: 6th Circuit filing; file response to motion to stay; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference.	1.80
04/04/14	John L. Farringer	Review edits to brief and declaration; correspondence re: same.	0.30
04/08/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference; multiple correspondence re: Sixth Circuit mediation.	0.20
04/08/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with M. Campbell; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer/William L. Harbison conference re: 6th Circuit mediation.	0.60
04/10/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Telephone conference with Sixth Circuit mediation office; telephone conference with J. Scott Hickman; emails with group re: Sixth Circuit mediation.	0.50
04/10/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: call with case manager and mediation; correspondence re: proposed article and review article.	0.30
04/10/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer telephone conference.	0.20
04/11/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel.	0.20
04/14/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review Ohio decisions; multiple emails with counsel re: supplemental filing.	0.70
04/14/14	William L. Harbison	Review Ohio opinion; email; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference.	1.00
04/14/14	John L. Farringer	Review Ohio opinion; multiple correspondence re: same and strategy.	0.40
04/14/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review Ohio decision; emails with co-counsel re: same.	0.60
04/20/14	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence re: insurance and social security card.	0.20
04/21/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Email re: additional decisions.	0.10
04/21/14	John L. Farringer	Review Indiana and Ohio opinions; correspondence re: same.	0.20
04/22/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: next steps.	0.30
04/25/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review order; multiple emails with counsel.	0.30
04/25/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference.	0.20

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
04/25/14	William L. Harbison	Review emails and Court of Appeals ruling.	1.00
04/25/14	John L. Farringer	Review court order on stay; multiple correspondence re: same and correspondence with clients; telephone conference with S. Minter.	0.40
04/28/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; public records research.	0.30
05/01/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Email from amicus request; email with J. Scott Hickman.	0.10
05/01/14	J. Scott Hickman	Various co-counsel costs re: amicus requests; telephone conference with S. Minter re: same.	0.60
05/05/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: amicus.	0.20
05/05/14	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with C. Stoll re: amicus issues.	0.40
05/06/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with M. Campbell re: amicus issues.	0.30
05/07/14	John L. Farringer	Review Appellant brief; correspondence re: same.	0.60
05/08/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: brief and strategy; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: same; correspondence re: arguments; multiple correspondence re: amicus briefs.	0.60
05/08/14	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer conference; review brief.	1.00
05/08/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review State's brief.	1.30
05/08/14	J. Scott Hickman	Email M. Campbell re: amicus issues; emails with co-counsel re: same.	0.50
05/09/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails with co-counsel and amicus counsel; review filings.	0.60
05/09/14	John L. Farringer	Review notice of appearance for amicus curiae; conference call with M. Campbell; correspondence re: same; review amicus motion; multiple correspondence re: same and consent.	1.10
05/11/14	John L. Farringer	Review filings and correspondence from Friday; multiple correspondence re: same.	0.30
05/12/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Telephone conference with S. Minter; emails re: amicus.	0.70
05/12/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: amicus and briefing.	0.20
05/13/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails with counsel; review filings.	0.30
05/13/14	William L. Harbison	Emails ; William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer conference.	0.50
05/13/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conferences re: blanket consent and conference with S. Minter re: same.	0.60

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
05/13/14	J. Scott Hickman	File amicus consent; telephone conference with amicus counsel re: same; emails with co-counsel.	1.30
05/14/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails with counsel re: brief and amicus.	0.20
05/14/14	John L. Farringer	Review amicus briefs and correspondence re: Idaho and other matters; multiple correspondence re: our brief and amicus briefs.	0.70
05/14/14	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with co-counsel re: amicus issues and draft of brief.	0.40
05/15/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review amicus briefs ; emails with counsel re: same.	0.50
05/15/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference.	0.20
05/20/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: brief.	0.20
05/20/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: briefs and correspondence with S. Minter.	0.20
05/20/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: briefing issue.	0.20
05/21/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: consolidation and oral argument.	0.30
05/21/14	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with S. Minter; review memo re: conversations with 6 th Circuit Clerk.	0.40
05/22/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails with counsel.	0.20
05/22/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: brief and telephone conference.	0.30
05/22/14	J. Scott Hickman	Various emails re: status of 6th Circuit case and potential oral argument issues.	0.40
05/23/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Conference call with counsel; emails with same.	0.90
05/23/14	John L. Farringer	Review file to prepare for call; conference call with team.	0.80
05/23/14	J. Scott Hickman	Conference call with co-counsel re: oral argument issues; email S. Minter re: same; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference.	1.20
05/27/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: Sixth Circuit.	0.20
05/27/14	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference with 6th Circuit; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman; email.	1.50
05/27/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: call with case manager and strategy on oral argument.	0.30
05/27/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference; telephone conference with 6th Circuit Clerk; telephone conference with S. Minter.	1.00
05/28/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel.	0.10

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
05/29/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails with counsel re: Sixth Circuit brief.	0.20
05/29/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: option of asking for full review on appeal.	0.30
05/30/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review request to intervene; multiple emails with counsel re: brief.	0.20
05/30/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review email and related attachments from C. Sevier.	0.70
05/30/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: C. Sevier and intervention; review papers.	0.30
06/02/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: appellate brief.	0.20
06/02/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review/revise motion re: amicus briefs; emails with S. Minter re: same; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: brief deadline.	0.60
06/03/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on brief; revise same.	2.20
06/03/14	John L. Farringer	Review draft brief and multiple correspondence re: same; review questionnaire and correspondence re: same.	0.40
06/03/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Stoll and S. Minter.	0.60
06/04/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: brief.	0.20
06/04/14	William L. Harbison	Review appellate brief; emails.	2.50
06/04/14	John L. Farringer	Review brief and comments; correspondence re: brief and suggestions.	0.60
06/04/14	J. Scott Hickman	Revise brief; review and incorporate Phillip F. Cramer/William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer comments.	2.30
06/05/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with J. Scott Hickman, S. Minter, William L. Harbison and Amy R. Mohan.	0.20
06/05/14	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference with Minister; review emails.	0.50
06/05/14	J. Scott Hickman	Revise brief; coordinate Sherrard & Roe changes; circulate brief to co-counsel.	1.30
06/06/14	Amy R. Mohan	Cite check Sixth Circuit Brief.	3.00
06/06/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on brief; emails with counsel.	0.90
06/08/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: brief; work on same.	0.30
06/08/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review/revise draft brief; emails with co-counsel re: same; telephone conference with S. Minter re: same.	0.80
06/09/14	J. Scott Hickman	Finalize and file brief in 6th Circuit.	5.80
06/09/14	Amy R. Mohan	Prepare brief for filing with final cite check and compliance check.	0.50
06/09/14	William L. Harbison	Review brief; emails.	1.30
06/09/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Proofread and revise brief; work on tables and addendum; finalize brief.	5.90
06/09/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: edits to brief; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; final review of brief and edits to same;	4.70

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
		review court order; finalize and file brief; correspondence re: same.	
06/10/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Letter from Sixth Circuit; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails with group.	0.40
06/10/14	J. Scott Hickman	Revise appendix and file revised brief; various emails with co- counsel; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same.	1.20
06/10/14	John L. Farringer	Review briefing letter; conference re: same and new filing; multiple correspondence re: same; review corrected brief.	0.50
06/11/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: brief and oral argument.	0.30
06/11/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer conference; emails with co-counsel re: oral argument.	0.60
06/11/14	William L. Harbison	Emails; telephone conference with A. Rubinfeld; review file.	1.50
06/11/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: oral argument; conference re: same.	0.30
06/12/14	John L. Farringer	Review filings; correspondence re: same.	0.20
06/12/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference re: oral argument in 6th Circuit.	0.30
06/16/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review amicus briefs.	2.20
06/16/14	John L. Farringer	Review amicus brief of American Psychological Association, et al.; review multiple other amicus briefs; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; review additional amicus briefs.	1.80
06/16/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review Amicus briefs and emails with S. Minter re: same.	0.60
06/17/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Read and analyze numerous amicus briefs; Phillip F. Cramer/William L. Harbison conference; emails with same re: oral argument.	7.10
06/17/14	William L. Harbison	Review amicus briefs; emails.	4.50
06/17/14	John L. Farringer	Review amicus briefs; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: same and oral argument; work on oral argument acknowledgement form; correspondence re: amicus briefs; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: briefs; correspondence re: article and amicus briefs.	1.10
06/17/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review amicus briefs and conferences with co-counsel re: same and preparations for oral argument; conference re: potential amicus filings.	1.20
06/18/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review notices from Sixth Circuit; email re: oral argument.	0.30

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
06/18/14	William L. Harbison	Review briefs; emails; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; telephone conference with Minter.	2.50
06/18/14	John L. Farringer	Review articles and correspondence re: same.	0.20
06/18/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference re: oral argument; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison telephone conference with S. Minter re: same.	0.90
06/24/14	William L. Harbison	Review amicus briefs.	1.50
06/25/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails re: 10th Circuit opinion; review letter to Court of Appeals.	0.40
06/25/14	William L. Harbison	Review 10th Circuit opinion; emails; review supplemental authority filing; William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer conference.	3.60
06/25/14	John L. Farringer	Review 10th Circuit opinion; multiple correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: supplemental filing; correspondence re: letter; draft letter to court; send draft letter to group; multiple correspondence re: same.	2.20
06/26/14	William L. Harbison	Review brief; email; research; William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer conference.	1.60
06/26/14	John L. Farringer	Edit Rule 28(j) letter; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: same; finalize and file letter; review reply brief of government; correspondence re: same.	0.90
06/26/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: State's reply brief.	0.20
06/27/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review reply brief; emails with counsel re: same.	0.50
06/30/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: argument; review filing.	0.20
06/30/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer conferences re: argument notes; review notice of appearance; correspondence re: same.	0.30
07/01/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review Kentucky decision.	0.10
07/02/14	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with S. Minter.	0.30
07/03/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Order from court ; filings with court.	0.10
07/03/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: mock argument; review court order on amicus motions; review Kentucky opinion; correspondence re: quote for oral argument.	0.40
07/03/14	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with S. Minter re: oral argument.	0.20
07/07/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails re: oral argument and preparation.	0.30
07/07/14	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference regarding oral argument; telephone conference with Sixth Circuit; emails.	1.00

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
07/07/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: hearing and logistics; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	0.30
07/07/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter re: oral argument and coordination with counsel in other cases; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer conference re: same; emails with co-counsel re: same.	1.80
07/08/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: argument.	0.20
07/08/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: hearing; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conferences re: preparation and meeting; correspondence re: preparation.	0.50
07/10/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: oral argument prep.	0.20
07/11/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: argument prep.	0.10
07/11/14	William L. Harbison	Telephone conferences; emails.	1.00
07/14/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Order from Court; emails re: argument prep.	0.20
07/14/14	John L. Farringer	Review order from court re: oral argument; correspondence re: same; correspondence re: preparation meeting.	0.40
07/14/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter re: preparation for oral argument.	0.30
07/15/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: argument and meeting.	0.20
07/16/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: hearing and preparation; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	0.30
07/16/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review 6th Circuit correspondence re: oral argument; conferences with co-counsel re: same; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison emails re: same.	0.50
07/17/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review filing; emails with J. Scott Hickman.	0.70
07/17/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: C. Sevier correspondence and lawsuit; correspondence re: oral argument and meeting.	0.30
07/17/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review recent pleadings in related cases and emails with co- counsel re: same; emails re: oral argument issues.	2.20
07/18/14	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with S. Minter re: oral argument and recent rulings.	0.20
07/21/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: oral argument.	0.10
07/21/14	J. Scott Hickman	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: hearing and correspondence; multiple correspondence re: panel.	0.30
07/21/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: hearing and correspondence; multiple correspondence re: panel.	0.30
07/22/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Panel research and emails; argument prep work.	1.10

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
07/22/14	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison; email with S. Minter; email with R. Lambert; email with other counsel in firm who recently clerked on Sixth Circuit re: panel; draft correspondence to 6th Circuit re: attendees at oral argument.	1.60
07/23/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/Kimberly M. Ingram conference; emails re: panel research.	0.50
07/23/14	Amy R. Mohan	ARM/J. Scott Hickman conference regarding oral argument panel.	0.20
07/23/14	Kimberly M. Ingram	Kimberly M. Ingram/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: researching opinions and writings of Judges Sutton and Cook.	2.00
07/23/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: panel; review letter to 6th Circuit re: oral argument; review articles by judges.	0.30
07/23/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference; send correspondence to 6th Circuit re: attendees at oral argument; emails with William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer; email A. Rubenfeld; email C. Stoll.	1.00
07/24/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review law review article and writings by panel members of Court.	1.50
07/24/14	Kimberly M. Ingram	Research opinions and writings of Judges Sutton and Cook.	6.00
07/24/14	John L. Farringer	Review documents from C. Sevier; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	0.30
07/24/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review law review article and 10th Circuit opinion; numerous calls and emails re: potential oral argument preparation session with other counsel; internal and external conferences re: same; prepare notebook for oral argument preparation; review Severe email and attachment.	3.00
07/25/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Argument prep; numerous emails re: same.	0.90
07/25/14	Ryan T. Holt	Ryan T. Holt/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference re: moot argument; strategy call with oral argument team across states.	1.80
07/25/14	Kimberly M. Ingram	Research opinions and writings of Judges Sutton and Cook.	3.60
07/25/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: team call and moot court room; work on appellate room; review outline for call; review correspondence and notes; conference call with S. Minter; conference call with team re: oral argument strategy; correspondence re: same.	2.60
07/25/14	J. Scott Hickman	Status emails with co-counsel re: preparation for oral argument.	0.40

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
07/27/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: moot court and logistics.	0.20
07/28/14	William L. Harbison	Emails; William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer telephone conference; telephone conference with Zanbert.	2.50
07/28/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails and calls re: Sixth Circuit prep; review Fourth Circuit opinion.	2.80
07/28/14	Kimberly M. Ingram	Research writings and opinions of Judges Sutton and Cook; compose memorandum on research.	2.70
07/28/14	John L. Farringer	Review memo on amicus briefs; multiple correspondence re: moot court and planning session; multiple conferences and calls re: same; conference call with S. Minter re: strategy; multiple correspondence re: moot court and meeting and logistics; review 4th Circuit opinion and correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: hearing and moot court.	2.60
07/29/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Argument prep; numerous emails re: same.	1.10
07/29/14	Kimberly M. Ingram	Complete memorandum on the writings and opinions of Judges Sutton and Cook.	2.70
07/29/14	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer conference; prepare for argument.	3.00
07/29/14	J. Scott Hickman	Various calls and conferences re: oral argument preparation.	2.60
07/29/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: moot court; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same and strategy; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: strategy, arguments and potential questions from panel; multiple correspondence re: same; review summary of panel judges' past decisions.	1.70
07/30/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Meeting with William L. Harbison and other counsel re: oral argument; prepare for moot court.	3.40
07/30/14	William L. Harbison	Prepare for agreement; meet with counsel.	4.00
07/30/14	J. Scott Hickman	Various calls and conferences re: oral argument preparation.	1.80
07/30/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: Rule 28(j) letter and argument; review recent opinions; conference re: same; correspondence re: moot court.	0.60
07/31/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Prepare for moot court; moot court; meeting with counsel.	12.60
07/31/14	J. Scott Hickman	Prepare for and participate in group meeting re: 6th Circuit preparation; email D. Hunt at 6th Circuit.	10.00

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
07/31/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: Rule 28(j) letter; review file; meeting with teams from all states; moot court.	6.30
07/31/14	William L. Harbison	Meet with counsel to prepare for argument.	7.00
07/31/14	Kimberly M. Ingram	Attend moot arguments and Cooper luncheon on marriage equality cases.	5.70
08/01/14	William L. Harbison	Meet with counsel; prepare for argument.	8.00
08/01/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Prepare for argument; meeting with counsel; emails with counsel.	3.60
08/01/14	Kimberly M. Ingram	Compose summary of application of Judge Sutton's opinions to this case.	1.50
08/01/14	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence and notes from moot court; meeting with Tennessee team to prepare for oral argument.	2.60
08/01/14	J. Scott Hickman	Meeting with all Tennessee counsel to prepare for oral argument; email D. Hunt re: attendees at oral argument; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison re: oral argument preparation; prepare outline of cases for William L. Harbison.	3.40
08/02/14	William L. Harbison	Prepare for argument.	8.00
08/03/14	William L. Harbison	Prepare for argument.	7.00
08/03/14	John L. Farringer	Review documents outlining arguments on multiple issues; multiple correspondence re: same; work on standing argument; correspondence re: same; review 4th Circuit opinion and briefing on standing.	1.20
08/03/14	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with co-counsel re: oral argument preparations.	0.40
08/04/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review numerous emails, articles and discussion re: oral argument prep.	0.60
08/04/14	John L. Farringer	Legal research; correspondence re: same; prepare for oral argument; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	1.00
08/04/14	William L. Harbison	Prepare for argument.	4.00
08/04/14	J. Scott Hickman	Prepare for oral argument; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conferences re: oral argument; prepare case memo for oral argument; emails with co-counsel re: logistics at 6th Circuit.	2.60
08/05/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: oral argument.	0.30
08/05/14	J. Scott Hickman	Travel to Cincinnati; various conferences re: oral argument with William L. Harbison and other co-counsel; prepare for oral argument.	7.00
08/05/14	John L. Farringer	Review research and notes; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: strategy; travel to Cincinnati; John L. Farringer/William L.	6.40

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
		Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: strategy; review notes and prepare for oral argument.	
08/05/14	William L. Harbison	Prepare for argument in Cincinnati, OH.	10.00
08/06/14	William L. Harbison	Argument; meetings.	12.00
08/06/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails with counsel re: oral argument; telephone conference with counsel.	0.60
08/06/14	J. Scott Hickman	Prepare for and attend 6th Circuit argument; travel to Nashville.	14.50
08/06/14	John L. Farringer	Prepare for oral argument; oral argument at 6th Circuit; multiple conferences re: same; travel time.	12.10
08/07/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review audio of hearing; emails with counsel.	0.90
08/07/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conferences and emails with other co-counsel re: oral argument and next steps.	1.30
08/07/14	John L. Farringer	Review media reports and correspondence re: same; discuss oral argument.	0.40
08/08/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: oral argument follow-up.	0.20
08/08/14	J. Scott Hickman	Various emails re: oral argument and next steps in case with co- counsel.	0.40
08/11/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: oral argument and follow-up.	0.50
08/12/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel.	0.10
08/13/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails re: new decision.	0.20
08/13/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review Roane County decision; emails with co-counsel re: same.	0.30
08/27/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: 7th Circuit argument and reviews.	0.20
09/05/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review Seventh Circuit opinion; emails with J. Scott Hickman.	0.30
09/05/14	John L. Farringer	Review 7th Circuit opinion; correspondence re: same.	0.40
09/05/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review 7th Circuit opinion; emails with co-counsel re: same.	0.70
09/16/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: cert and opinion.	0.20
09/16/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference; telephone conference with S. Minter re: potential certiorari petition and related issues.	0.60
09/17/14	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference regarding appeal.	0.40
09/17/14	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: potential certiorari petition.	0.30

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
09/18/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel.	0.10
09/18/14	Amy R. Mohan	Review and summarize Supreme Court Rules related to cert petition.	0.60
09/18/14	J. Scott Hickman	Conference with S. Minter and R. Lambert re: pending cases; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference re: same; emails with co-counsel re: case status and pending state case, potential certiorari petition; review Amy R. Mohan memo.	1.20
09/18/14	John L. Farringer	Review articles re: 6th Circuit decision; multiple correspondence re: Tennessee state case; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	0.20
09/26/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: status update and strategy; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	0.40
09/26/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter re: status of case; potential filings when 6th Circuit rules.	0.40
10/01/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference.	0.20
10/01/14	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with co-counsel re: status of appeal and potential certiorari petition.	0.30
10/02/14	John L. Farringer	Review reports on Supreme Court; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	0.10
10/03/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: opinion and strategy.	0.10
10/03/14	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with S. Minter re: status of case, analysis of SCOTUS status on certiorari petitions.	0.40
10/06/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; review cert denials; emails with counsel.	0.20
10/06/14	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; research regarding court denials; emails.	1.50
10/06/14	John L. Farringer	Review press re: Supreme Court denials of certiorari; multiple conferences re: same.	0.30
10/06/14	J. Scott Hickman	Various emails and telephone conferences with co-counsel re: effect of SCOTUS denial of certiorari in pending cases.	1.40
10/08/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: articles and strategy.	0.20
10/09/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Prepare for conference; Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: contingencies and next steps.	1.10
10/09/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: recent developments and strategy depending on decision.	0.80

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
10/10/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on review of case to date; review and summarize arguments; emails with counsel re: next steps.	1.90
10/10/14	John L. Farringer	Review Idaho briefs and multiple articles; correspondence with 6 th Circuit team on strategy.	0.30
10/10/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review recent pleadings in other cases pending with SCOTUS; email with co-counsel re: same; status emails re: SCOTUS denial of stay in Idaho case; review memo re: 6th Circuit strategy.	0.80
10/12/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: certiorari, strategy and call.	0.30
10/13/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails and conference with counsel.	0.30
10/13/14	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: strategy.	0.10
10/13/14	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter re: status, strategy; multiple emails with co-counsel re: same; telephone conference with M. Campbell re: possible substitution of attorney general.	1.20
10/14/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; email with William L. Harbison; email with counsel.	1.00
10/14/14	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; telephone conference with counsel regarding status and appeal; review 6th Circuit judges.	2.00
10/14/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: agenda and call; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: call and strategy; correspondence re: en banc and other issues.	0.30
10/14/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference; review 9th Circuit orders; status email with S. Minter.	1.30
10/15/14	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference with R. Lambert; review emails regarding Sixth Circuit strategy.	1.20
10/24/14	John L. Farringer	Review articles on status; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	0.20
10/30/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Email with S. Minter re: First Circuit and Fifth Circuit.	0.20
11/06/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review opinion; numerous emails re: next steps; conference calls with counsel.	3.60
11/06/14	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference calls and emails regarding Sixth Circuit ruling.	2.30
11/06/14	John L. Farringer	Review opinion and judgment; multiple correspondence re: same; John L.	1.60

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
		Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same; conference call with S. Minter re: same; correspondence re: call; review articles on opinion.	
11/06/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review 6th Circuit opinion; various calls and emails with co- counsel re: opinion and next steps.	2.70
11/07/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Conference call re: cert petition; outline arguments for cert; numerous emails with counsel.	3.70
11/07/14	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference calls; emails; meeting regarding Sixth Circuit decision; telephone conference with counsel.	1.50
11/07/14	J. Scott Hickman	Various conference calls with co-counsel and counsel from other status re: 6th Circuit ruling.	3.60
11/07/14	John L. Farringer	Review opinion; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: opinion and strategy; multiple correspondence with team; conference call with all counsel re: strategy; review Utah and Idaho briefs.	1.50
11/09/14	John L. Farringer	Review article on clients; multiple correspondence re: same and retaining Supreme Court counsel.	0.30
11/10/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on materials re: case presentation and cert petition.	2.30
11/10/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: correspondence and strategy; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: same.	0.20
11/11/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails with counsel.	0.50
11/11/14	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: draft of cert petition; emails with S. Minter; telephone conference with M. Holland.	0.90
11/11/14	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: brief strategy; multiple correspondence re: potential article; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: brief and argument.	0.30
11/12/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails about cert petition.	0.30
11/12/14	John L. Farringer	Review reports on South Carolina case; multiple correspondence re: draft brief; plan for meeting re: draft brief; review cases for brief; review and comment on draft petition.	1.30
11/12/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review SCOTUS order re: stay in South Carolina case; email co- counsel re: same.	0.30
11/13/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on cert petition; multiple emails re: same; conference re: appendix.	3.70

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
11/13/14	William L. Harbison	Review and revise court petition; meet with counsel.	1.50
11/13/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review/revise cert petition; conference with co-counsel re: same; numerous emails with co-counsel re: draft and edits.	2.60
11/13/14	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence and edits to brief; review brief; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: edits; review draft appendix; research re: past exceptions to recognition; multiple correspondence re: further edits; correspondence re: quotes for press; review additional edits.	2.90
11/14/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails re: cert petition; Phillip F. Cramer/William L. Harbison conference.	0.50
11/14/14	William L. Harbison	Emails regarding cert petition.	0.50
11/14/14	John L. Farringer	Review final version of brief and appendix; multiple correspondence re: same; review correspondence and articles re: petitions of other states; correspondence re: filing; review articles.	0.80
11/17/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: filings; review Michigan petition.	0.40
11/17/14	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails regarding court petition.	0.65
11/17/14	John L. Farringer	Review petitions from Michigan and Kentucky and correspondence re: same; multiple correspondence re: response, reply and conference timing.	0.40
11/17/14	J. Scott Hickman	Numerous emails re: SCOTUS petitions and related developments; review Michigan cert petition; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference re: potential communication with attorney general's office.	0.70
11/18/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: petition; review documents.	0.40
11/18/14	John L. Farringer	Review Michigan petition; correspondence re: deadlines.	0.20
11/20/14	John L. Farringer	Review report re: stay denial in South Carolina case; correspondence re: same.	0.20
11/20/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel; review order re: stay.	0.20
11/20/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review SCOTUS order re: stay in South Carolina case; email co- counsel re: same.	0.30
11/23/14	John L. Farringer	Review article on case and correspondence re: same and plaintiffs' status.	0.30
11/24/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: cert petitions.	0.20
11/25/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Email re: Michigan Attorney General response.	0.10
11/25/14	John L. Farringer	Review report re: Michigan supporting petition; correspondence re: same and contacting attorney general.	0.20

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
11/26/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; multiple emails with counsel re: Tennessee Attorney General.	0.60
11/26/14	William L. Harbison	Emails regarding supreme court appeal.	0.80
11/26/14	John L. Farringer	Review Mississippi opinion; correspondence re: same; correspondence with team re: reaching out to Tennessee attorney general; conference call with team re: same and strategy; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman telephone conference with M. Campbell; correspondence re: same.	1.20
11/26/14	J. Scott Hickman	Conference call with co-counsel; telephone conference with M. Campbell in Tennessee attorney general's office re: case status and timing of filings; emails with co-counsel re: same.	1.20
12/02/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review Louisiana Attorney General petition re: cert.	0.20
12/04/14	William L. Harbison	Review and respond to emails.	0.50
12/04/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: amicus brief and strategy; review report on Michigan case at conference.	0.40
12/04/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; multiple emails re: amicus and cert petition.	0.40
12/04/14	J. Scott Hickman	Email with co-counsel re: consent to amicus briefs.	0.40
12/05/14	John L. Farringer	Review article and correspondence re: same; correspondence re: new amicus brief and not opposing amicus briefing; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: article; multiple correspondence re: C. Sevier intervention.	0.80
12/05/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails with counsel.	0.30
12/08/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails with counsel; emails from Intervenor.	0.40
12/08/14	William L. Harbison	Emails regarding certified petition.	1.00
12/08/14	John L. Farringer	Review brief from C. Sevier; correspondence with A. Rubinfeld re: article; review article on certiorari analysis and correspondence re: same.	0.50
12/09/14	William L. Harbison	Review Email and attachments.	1.50
12/09/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review amicus brief; review motion to intervene.	1.30
12/09/14	John L. Farringer	Review motion to intervene and correspondence re: same; review amicus brief; correspondence with S. Minter re: same and conferences; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re:	0.50

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
		specialists; correspondence re: Kentucky position.	
12/10/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: amicus and cert petition.	0.20
12/10/14	William L. Harbison	Emails.	0.60
12/10/14	John L. Farringer	Review Kentucky filing; review multiple correspondence re: same and Tennessee; review amicus brief of Freedom to Marry and correspondence re: filing.	0.40
12/10/14	J. Scott Hickman	Emails re: amicus briefs.	0.30
12/11/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review amicus brief.	0.20
12/12/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: Ohio response to cert petition.	0.10
12/12/14	John L. Farringer	Review Ohio response; multiple correspondence re: same.	0.30
12/15/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review response to cert petition; emails with counsel.	0.50
12/15/14	William L. Harbison	Emails regarding Supreme Court case.	0.50
12/15/14	John L. Farringer	Review Tennessee brief in opposition to certiorari; multiple correspondence re: same and strategy on reply; review several amicus briefs.	0.50
12/16/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: reply to state's response; review amicus.	0.40
12/16/14	William L. Harbison	Emails regarding Supreme Court.	1.00
12/17/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review outline of reply; email with counsel.	0.30
12/19/14	J. Scott Hickman	Review reply brief; emails with co-counsel re: same.	1.00
12/19/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Review reply brief; emails re: same.	0.70
12/19/14	William L. Harbison	Emails regarding briefs.	0.50
12/19/14	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence re: draft reply brief and waiving delay; review draft reply brief; multiple correspondence re: same.	0.40
12/21/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails with counsel re: reply brief.	0.40
12/21/14	John L. Farringer	Review edits to reply; review multiple correspondence re: same and filing plans.	0.40
12/21/14	J. Scott Hickman	Various emails re: reply brief and review same.	0.70
12/22/14	William L. Harbison	Emails.	0.50
12/22/14	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: reply filing.	0.10
12/22/14	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: filed reply; review same.	0.20
12/22/14	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with co-counsel re: filing of reply brief.	0.40
12/23/14	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: conference and potential argument and briefing schedule.	0.30
01/02/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with J. Minter; review article.	0.20
01/07/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel; prepare application to U.S. Supreme Court.	0.40
01/09/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review order; emails re: cert petition.	0.10

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
01/09/15	William L. Harbison	Review and respond to emails, including attachments.	1.00
01/09/15	J. Scott Hickman	Numerous emails with co-counsel re: U.S. Supreme Court status and next steps.	0.60
01/09/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: conference today and possible announcement; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; multiple correspondence re: press and strategy.	0.70
01/11/15	William L. Harbison	Emails.	1.00
01/12/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: order; check Court website for orders.	0.10
01/12/15	William L. Harbison	Emails.	0.30
01/12/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: announcements today and possible scenarios.	0.20
01/13/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Conference re: plaintiffs.	0.20
01/13/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter re: status of plaintiffs; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same; telephone conference with Day H-D.	1.00
01/13/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: client move and strategy.	0.20
01/14/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Conference call with counsel re: cert petition.	0.50
01/14/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier, S. Minter and C. Stoll	0.70
01/14/15	John L. Farringer	Review Scotusblog and correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: party moving; conference call with team re: same.	0.50
01/15/15	J. Scott Hickman	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: status.	0.20
01/15/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review cert petition from NC.	0.10
01/15/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: conference and North Carolina case.	0.20
01/16/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review order; voluminous emails re: SC brief and oral argument.	1.50
01/16/15	J. Scott Hickman	Emails and telephone conference with co-counsel re: grant of cert by SCOTUS and related issues.	1.40
01/16/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: Supreme Court announcement; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; review order and articles re: same; multiple correspondence; call from media; multiple correspondence re: conference call and strategy.	2.00
01/16/15	William L. Harbison	Emails and telephone conferences regarding Supreme Court grant of cert.	7.00

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
01/17/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: decision, strategy and calls.	0.40
01/18/15	John L. Farringer	Review articles; multiple correspondence re: strategy calls.	0.40
01/19/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel for all four cases; conference call with Tennessee counsel re: next steps; emails with same; email with S. Minter re: amicus.	1.40
01/19/15	J. Scott Hickman	Conference call with Tennessee counsel re: SCOTUS issues; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conferences re: same.	1.40
01/19/15	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence and outline for conference call; conference call with team; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference; review articles; correspondence re: group call tomorrow.	1.70
01/19/15	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference with S. Minter; telephone conference with TN counsel group; emails.	2.50
01/20/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference; conference call with all counsel; review and revise outline of brief.	3.30
01/20/15	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference re: status/briefing.	1.00
01/20/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: strategy and call; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference call with S. Minter re: same; strategy call with all states' teams; multiple correspondence re: appendix and other issues.	2.20
01/20/15	William L. Harbison	Conference with counsel regarding Supreme Court issues.	1.00
01/22/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: oral argument.	0.10
01/23/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: oral argument.	0.20
01/23/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: brief and Alabama order.	0.20
01/25/15	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence and article on legal case.	0.20
01/26/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on amicus research; review amicus briefs from Sixth Circuit.	4.10
01/26/15	J. Scott Hickman	Conferences with William L. Harbison, et al.	0.30
01/27/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on amicus issues; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference.	1.40
01/29/15	William L. Harbison	Meet with client and R. Lambert.	2.50
02/02/15	William L. Harbison	Emails with counsel regarding Supreme Court.	0.50
02/03/15	John L. Farringer	Review draft joint appendix; correspondence re: same.	0.20

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
02/03/15	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference re: appendix; review emails re: same.	0.30
02/04/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: message on oral arguments and strategy.	0.10
02/05/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails and letter from Clerk.	0.10
02/09/15	John L. Farringer	Review information re: Alabama decision re: stay; multiple correspondence re: same.	0.30
02/09/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review order from Supreme Court.	0.10
02/09/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails; review court decision.	1.00
02/09/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review order in Alabama case; emails with co-counsel re: same; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference.	0.70
02/10/15	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference re: status of briefing and oral argument.	0.30
02/10/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: Alabama case; emails re: brief.	0.20
02/10/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails.	0.30
02/12/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: proceedings and Supreme Court.	0.20
02/13/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel.	0.20
02/15/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel.	0.10
02/15/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: oral argument and conversations with clerk.	0.30
02/16/15	William L. Harbison	Emails.	0.50
02/16/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on motion and edits; emails with S. Minter.	0.70
02/16/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: exchanging draft briefs; correspondence re: Alabama issue.	0.30
02/17/15	John L. Farringer	Review draft brief; correspondence re: same.	1.90
02/18/15	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference; telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier re: brief; review draft SCOTUS brief.	2.40
02/18/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails and work on brief.	0.20
02/18/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: draft brief and edits; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; review draft and edits; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference call; outline issues for discussion; correspondence and conference call with D. Hallward-Driemeier, William L. Harbison and J. Scott Hickman; work on edits to brief.	2.50
02/19/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on brief; emails re: same.	2.70
02/19/15	John L. Farringer	Work on draft brief; correspondence re: same; review edits from A. Rubinfeld and R.	0.90

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
		Lambert; edit brief; correspondence with team re: same.	
02/19/15	J. Scott Hickman	Revise draft SCOTUS brief; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conferences re: same.	1.40
02/20/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails and revisions to brief.	0.30
02/20/15	William L. Harbison	Emails and review draft briefs.	2.00
02/20/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review and revise brief; conferences with co-counsel re: same; numerous emails re: briefing and related issues.	3.10
02/20/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: edits to brief and exchanging drafts; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; review multiple additional edits and correspondence re: draft briefs.	0.60
02/21/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on edits to brief and review of other briefs; numerous emails re: same.	5.30
02/21/15	William L. Harbison	Emails; review draft.	2.00
02/21/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review briefs of other petitioners; review revise brief; numerous emails with co-counsel re: same.	4.40
02/21/15	John L. Farringer	Review latest version of draft; review correspondence; review drafts of Ohio, Michigan and Kentucky; multiple correspondence re: same; review additional edits; correspondence re: same.	1.90
02/22/15	William L. Harbison	Emails; review drafts.	2.00
02/22/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review briefs of other petitioners; review revise brief; numerous emails with co-counsel re: same.	2.20
02/22/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: briefs, edits, other briefs and comments.	0.70
02/23/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on brief and related issues.	0.40
02/23/15	William L. Harbison	Review emails and briefs.	1.00
02/23/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review/revise Supreme Court Brief; conferences re: same.	0.50
02/23/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: brief and correspondence; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: same; correspondence re: joint appendix.	0.30
02/24/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on brief; conference call re: same; emails re: edits.	2.80
02/24/15	William L. Harbison	Emails; telephone conference with Minter; meet with counsel; review and revise brief.	3.00
02/24/15	J. Scott Hickman	Various conferences/telephone conferences re: Supreme Court Brief; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conferences re: brief and related issues; review and revise brief.	3.50

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
02/24/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: final review of brief; review brief and edit summary of argument; correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same; conference call with S. Minter re: same; review edits of others; multiple correspondence re: same.	2.20
02/25/15	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference; emails with co-counsel; review draft brief and related matters.	0.80
02/25/15	William L. Harbison	Emails and review briefs.	2.00
02/25/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: brief; review amicus chart.	0.60
02/25/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: amici briefs and other issues; review list of amici briefs.	0.30
02/26/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails re: filing.	0.20
02/26/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review final proof of brief; emails with co-counsel re: same.	0.80
02/27/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails re: filing.	0.30
02/27/15	William L. Harbison	Emails; review briefs; telephone conference with counsel.	3.50
02/27/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: filing brief and related issues.	0.20
02/27/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference; review SCOTUS briefs.	3.00
03/01/15	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence and article re: oral argument choice.	0.30
03/02/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review amicus brief; emails re: oral argument; conference re: same.	0.90
03/02/15	William L. Harbison	Emails; review brief.	1.00
03/02/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: oral argument and calls re: same; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; multiple correspondence re: mock argument.	0.80
03/02/15	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with co-counsel re: moot; review briefs filed by other teams; emails with S. Minter.	1.00
03/03/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails and review amicus briefs.	0.20
03/03/15	William L. Harbison	Emails and review amicus briefs.	1.50
03/03/15	J. Scott Hickman	Email D. Hallward-Driemeier re: amicus briefs; review amicus briefs; review Alabama Supreme Court order; telephone conference with S. Minter re: same.	2.00
03/04/15	William L. Harbison	Review brief.	1.50
03/04/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review amicus briefs; emails with counsel.	0.30
03/04/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: preparation and oral argument; review amicus briefs filed; multiple correspondence re: same and articles.	0.50
03/04/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review amicus briefs.	2.00

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
03/05/15	William L. Harbison	Review briefs and emails.	1.50
03/05/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review amicus briefs ; emails re: moot court.	0.70
03/05/15	John L. Farringer	Review multiple amicus briefs and argument setting; correspondence re: same; multiple correspondence re: moot courts; review additional amicus briefs and correspondence re: same.	1.90
03/06/15	William L. Harbison	Emails and review brief; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference.	2.50
03/06/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails re: briefs; begin review of amicus brief.	0.80
03/06/15	John L. Farringer	Review multiple amicus briefs and correspondence re: same; multiple emails re: moot argument; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same; continue reviewing amicus briefs.	1.20
03/06/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier and co- counsel re: arrangements for moots in D.C.; continue review of amicus briefs; numerous emails re: preparation for moots in D.C.	4.50
03/08/15	William L. Harbison	Read amicus briefs; email.	2.00
03/08/15	John L. Farringer	Review multiple amicus briefs; correspondence re: same.	1.00
03/09/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review amicus briefs; emails re: moot court and panelists.	7.10
03/09/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: moot courts; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference; review Roberts analysis memo; multiple correspondence re: same and panelists for moot court.	1.00
03/09/15	J. Scott Hickman	Numerous emails re: moots in D.C.; research re: potential judges for moots in D.C.; telephone conferences with co-counsel and Sherrard & Roe attorneys re: potential judges.	2.20
03/10/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: moots; telephone conference re: oral arguments.	1.50
03/10/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: mock argument; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: same; review correspondence; work on travel logistics; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference call with S. Minter re: choosing argument presenter.	1.00
03/10/15	J. Scott Hickman	Emails re: logistics for moots in D.C.; coordinate with NCLR and Tennessee co-counsel re: same; telephone conference with	4.50

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
		S. Minter re: oral argument and preparation for group call; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same; research issues related to SCOTUS argument and admission for clients and counsel; telephone conference with NCLR and D. Hallward-Driemeier's office re: logistics for moots and SCOTUS argument.	
03/11/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Conferences re: oral argument; numerous emails.	2.60
03/11/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails; review briefs.	1.50
03/11/15	J. Scott Hickman	Numerous calls and emails re: logistics for SCOTUS moots and argument; conference call with counsel from other states and call with S. Minter re: moots and oral argument; telephone conference with other counsel re: Alabama case and potential impact on Tanco; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conferences re: moots and oral argument; emails re: potential moot court judges.	6.50
03/11/15	John L. Farringer	Conference call with teams re: oral argument and motion to divide; conference re: mock argument and logistics; correspondence re: moot court judges and location.	1.60
03/12/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: moot courts; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	0.60
03/12/15	J. Scott Hickman	Numerous calls/emails re: SCOTUS logistics, preparations for moots; telephone conference with S. Minter re: oral argument strategy and relationship of case to issues in Alabama; research and emails regarding potential judges for moots.	5.20
03/12/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: moot court judges; research potential judges; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; multiple correspondence re: moot off; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: same.	0.70
03/13/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with co-counsel re: QPZ motion/letter and other issues related to oral argument; emails re: moots/judges.	1.70
03/13/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: divided argument; review draft motion; emails with oralists.	0.80
03/13/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: moot arguments and Michigan announcement on solicitor general; conference call with several state's lawyers re: argument strategy.	0.90

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
03/14/15	John L. Farringer	Review draft letter to clerk on splitting arguments and edits to same; multiple correspondence re: same.	0.30
03/15/15	William L. Harbison	Emails; telephone conference calls with A. Rubanfeld.	1.30
03/15/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: letter and clerk on argument strategy; review final draft of combined letter.	0.40
03/16/15	William L. Harbison	Meet with counsel; emails; conference call regarding oral argument; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference.	3.60
03/16/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails re: letter and oral argument.	0.70
03/16/15	J. Scott Hickman	Numerous emails with counsel from all cases re: oral argument and related issues; review numerous drafts of letter to clerk; telephone conferences with all counsel re: same; telephone conference with A. Rubenfeld, S. Minter and D. Hallward-Driemeier re: clerk letter; telephone conferences with S. Minter.	5.20
03/16/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: letter to clerk; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; conference call with S. Minter re: same; multiple correspondence re: all lawyer call; review new version of letter to clerk; multiple correspondence re: same; review edits to letter; conference call with all states' teams re: letter and argument; review new version of letter to clerk; multiple correspondence re: same.	4.20
03/17/15	William L. Harbison	Emails regarding letter to court on oral argument.	1.50
03/17/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Numerous emails re: letter and oral argument.	0.80
03/17/15	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with co-counsel from all teams re: oral argument and letter to clerk.	0.80
03/17/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: final edits to letter; correspondence re: press release; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; correspondence re: letter and talking points; review news coverage re: letter.	1.20
03/18/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel.	0.20
03/18/15	J. Scott Hickman	Conference with Tennessee counsel re: oral argument and related issues; telephone conference with S. Minter re: same; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: same; numerous emails with counsel from all teams.	2.20

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
03/18/15	John L. Farringer	Review articles; multiple correspondence re: same and argument; multiple correspondence re: call from clerk and need for motion; multiple correspondence re: strategy on motion, letter and argument.	0.90
03/18/15	William L. Harbison	Telephone conference calls; emails; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference.	1.50
03/19/15	J. Scott Hickman	Conference call re: response to clerk regarding oral argument; emails re: same; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference.	0.90
03/19/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: update from clerk, strategy re: letter or motion on oralists and call.	0.50
03/19/15	William L. Harbison	Emails; telephone conference call with counsel.	2.80
03/19/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails re: oral argument; emails with J. Scott Hickman.	0.60
03/20/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter re: oral argument and moots.	0.70
03/20/15	William L. Harbison	Emails; research; review amicus briefs.	1.30
03/20/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails with counsel.	0.30
03/22/15	John L. Farringer	Review multiple correspondence and articles re: oralists decision; correspondence re: panel for moot argument.	0.30
03/23/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: moot court and Howard moot court.	0.20
03/23/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; review emails.	2.00
03/23/15	J. Scott Hickman	Prepare for moot on question 2; telephone conference with S. Minter; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer internal conferences re: moot and SCOTUS oral argument.	3.50
03/23/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: moot argument and strategy; work on logistics for argument; correspondence re: moot argument.	0.80
03/24/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Moot court prep; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference.	3.90
03/24/15	J. Scott Hickman	Moot with D. Hallward-Driemeier, et al.; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: moots and SCOTUS oral argument; telephone conference with S. Minter re: moots and SCOTUS oral argument.	5.00
03/24/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: moot argument on 3/25; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same and Michigan moot.	0.30

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
03/25/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Travel to and from Louisville; moot court and meeting with counsel.	10.30
03/25/15	J. Scott Hickman	Travel to/from Louisville for meeting with all teams and moot on QP2.	10.70
03/25/15	William L. Harbison	Emails and telephone conferences regarding Supreme Court case.	1.20
03/25/15	John L. Farringer	Attend moot argument in Louisville; conferences re: same.	10.30
03/26/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails with counsel; review amicus briefs; emails re: same.	0.40
03/26/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; discuss moot court.	1.00
03/26/15	John L. Farringer	Review amicus briefs in support of respondents; correspondence re: same.	0.30
03/26/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review amicus briefs; conferences with co-counsel re: Ann Arbor moot; conferences with co-counsel re: Louisville moot; various telephone conferences with Tennessee team re: preparations for oral argument at SCOTUS.	2.40
03/27/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; plan trip to MI; review briefs; emails.	2.50
03/27/15	John L. Farringer	Review various amicus briefs and correspondence re: same; review the states' briefs; correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	0.70
03/27/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review amicus briefs and Tennessee brief; telephone conference with S. Minter; conferences with M. Holland re: Michigan moot; telephone conference with S. Minter.	2.20
03/28/15	John L. Farringer	Review additional amicus brief; multiple correspondence re: same.	0.30
03/29/15	William L. Harbison	Attend moot court in MI; email; meet with counsel.	18.00
03/29/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: moot argument on question one; review draft letter on designation of counsel.	0.30
03/29/15	J. Scott Hickman	Travel to/from and participate in QP1 moot in Ann Arbor; review respondents briefs and conferences with co-counsel re: same.	18.50
03/30/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on reply brief; conference re: reply brief; review response briefs.	3.90
03/30/15	William L. Harbison	Emails; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference.	1.20
03/30/15	John L. Farringer	Review edits to letter to clerk and correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: mock argument yesterday; multiple	1.40

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
		correspondence with all counsel re: letter and contacting clerk; review additional amicus briefs; multiple correspondence re: letter to clerk and announcement on oralists.	
03/30/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with T. Brown, Phillip F. Cramer, et al. re: State's brief; outline of reply brief/review Michigan brief; review amicus briefs; numerous emails with co-counsel re: designation of oralists; begin review of sources cited in brief.	5.00
03/31/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review amicus briefs; emails re: reply and moot.	0.70
03/31/15	John L. Farringer	Review additional amicus briefs; review articles and correspondence re: oralists announcement.	0.60
03/31/15	J. Scott Hickman	Numerous emails re: selection of oralists and moots to prepare for SCOTUS argument; review briefs.	0.80
04/01/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review multiple amicus briefs.	0.20
04/01/15	William L. Harbison	Review amicus briefs.	1.00
04/01/15	John L. Farringer	Review additional amicus briefs; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: mock arguments and argument.	0.40
04/01/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review amicus briefs.	0.60
04/02/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review amicus briefs.	0.70
04/02/15	John L. Farringer	Review amicus briefs; correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; review additional amicus briefs; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: call with D. Hallward-Driemeier and moot argument in Nashville; legal research re: marriage definition; review amicus briefs.	1.80
04/02/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier, et al.; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference re: reply brief, schedule for preparation for oral argument and potential moot in Nashville; continue review of amicus briefs.	2.10
04/03/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review amicus briefs; emails with counsel.	1.30
04/03/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman; telephone conference calls with counsel; work on setting up a moot court; emails and review brief.	4.00
04/03/15	John L. Farringer	Review and comment on outline of reply brief; multiple correspondence re: same; review additional amicus briefs; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: Michigan brief and strategy; review order on	2.10

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
04/03/15	J. Scott Hickman	oral argument; review additional amicus briefs; correspondence re: same. Internal conferences re: Nashville moot; review outline of reply brief and emails re: same with co-counsel; email with D. Hallward- Driemeier re: potential moot in Nashville; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference re: Nashville moot.	1.10
04/04/15	John L. Farringer	Review amicus briefs and correspondence re: same.	0.50
04/06/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter re: preparation for moots and oral argument.	0.40
04/06/15	William L. Harbison	Emails; review briefs; office conference.	1.00
04/06/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review amicus briefs; emails re: moot courts; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	0.90
04/06/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: mock argument; review article on international law briefs.	0.30
04/07/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: moot court; conference re: moot court; prepare for same.	1.30
04/07/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: Nashville moot and SCOTUS oral argument; emails with co-counsel re: amicus briefs; telephone conference with D. Conan re: oral argument; emails with D. Hallward-Driemeier re: Nashville moot; telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier re: Nashville Moot.	3.80
04/07/15	William L. Harbison	Meet with counsel; emails.	2.00
04/07/15	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: mock argument and updates; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same; correspondence re: same; review additional amicus brief.	2.00
04/08/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on moot court questions; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference.	0.60
04/08/15	William L. Harbison	Emails; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; telephone conferences re: moot court.	1.50
04/08/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: mock argument in Nashville; review additional amicus briefs; telephone conference with J. Usman; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: mock argument; review articles and research; multiple correspondence re: same; correspondence with J. Usman.	1.20
04/08/15	J. Scott Hickman	Internal emails re: Nashville moot; research re: sources cited by State in its brief; emails	1.30

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
		with D. Hallward-Driemeier re: reply brief and related issues.	
04/09/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on reply brief; telephone conference with J. Scott Hickman; emails re: reply.	1.80
04/09/15	William L. Harbison	Emails; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference.	1.10
04/09/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence with J. Usman; multiple correspondence re: mock argument; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference; review full faith and credit portion of reply brief draft; correspondence re: same.	1.00
04/09/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review FFC section of draft reply brief; emails with D. Hallward- Driemeier re: same; telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier re: reply brief and issues related to oral argument; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: draft FFC section; telephone conference with S. Minter re: reply brief and oral arguments.	3.50
04/10/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Telephone conferences with J. Scott Hickman; work on reply; emails with counsel.	2.50
04/10/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same; review charts on amicus briefs and correspondence re: same.	0.40
04/10/15	J. Scott Hickman	Revise reply brief section re: FFC; telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier; telephone conference with S. Minter; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: draft revisions; numerous emails re: Nashville moot and oral argument.	4.30
04/11/15	J. Scott Hickman	Draft/revise reply brief; telephone conference with Hallward- Dreimeier; telephone conference with S. Minter; conference call with all co-counsel re: oral argument.	3.20
04/11/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Conference call with counsel; telephone conference with J. Scott Hickman; review reply brief.	2.40
04/11/15	William L. Harbison	Review draft brief; attorney conference call.	3.30
04/12/15	J. Scott Hickman	Draft/revise reply brief; various emails with co-counsel re: same; J. Scott Hickman/PRC telephone conference; telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier; review proposed revisions.	4.20
04/12/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on reply brief; numerous emails re: same; telephone conference with J. Scott Hickman.	3.60
04/12/15	William L. Harbison	Emails regarding brief; review drafts.	1.10

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
04/12/15	John L. Farringer	Review multiple correspondence and comments on draft reply; review and edit latest draft reply; multiple correspondence re: same; review additional edits.	2.30
04/13/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on reply brief; numerous calls and emails.	4.20
04/13/15	William L. Harbison	Emails; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference.	1.00
04/13/15	J. Scott Hickman	Draft/revise reply brief; telephone conference with K. Magill; telephone conference with S. Minter; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conferences; telephone conference with D. Canon; telephone conference with J. Martin; telephone conference with D. Hallward-Dreimier; numerous emails with co-counsel re: reply brief; oral argument and moots for SCOTUS argument.	6.20
04/13/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: reply brief, article and oral argument; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same; correspondence re: argument and articles; final review and edits of reply brief; correspondence re: same.	1.50
04/14/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on reply brief; numerous calls, conferences and emails re: oral argument, moot courts and reply.	3.20
04/14/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review and revise reply brief; conferences with D. Hallward-Driemeier and S. Minter re: oral argument; telephone conference with D. Canon; revise introduction to reply brief; telephone conference with D. Canon and J. Martin re: oral argument and moots; telephone conference with S. Minter; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference re: reply brief and issues related to moots/oral argument.	3.70
04/14/15	John L. Farringer	Review edits to reply brief and correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same and oral argument; correspondence re: oral argument and edits to reply brief.	0.70
04/15/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review and revise reply brief; numerous emails; telephone conference with Supreme Court Clerk.	1.30
04/15/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: reply brief, Georgetown moot argument and Nashville moot argument; John L. Farringer/J. Scott	1.30

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
04/15/15	J. Scott Hickman	Hickman conference re: same and seating; review final brief; correspondence re: same. Review/revise reply brief; numerous emails with co-counsel re: preparations for oral argument; telephone conferences with S. Minter and D. Hallward-Driemeier re: same; telephone conference with D. Canon re: oral argument; internal conferences re: reply brief.	4.60
04/16/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails re: reply brief; work on same.	1.20
04/16/15	J. Scott Hickman	Numerous calls and emails with co-counsel re: oral argument and related matters; telephone conference with J. Esselas; telephone conference with S. Minter; telephone conferences with D. Hallward-Driemeier re: moots and oral argument; telephone conference with D. Canon re: oral argument; telephone conference with K. Mogill re: oral argument.	4.60
04/16/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: brief and argument; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: argument and calls; correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: questions for oralists at mock argument.	1.20
04/17/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails re: brief, oral argument and moots.	0.30
04/17/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier, et al. re: preparation for oral argument; review briefs/reply briefs; prepare for moot.	7.20
04/17/15	John L. Farringer	Review filed reply briefs of all states; correspondence re: same; correspondence re: moot argument on 4/20; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; video conference with counsel to prepare.	1.60
04/18/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review cases and briefs; prepare for moot.	2.60
04/19/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on questions for moot court; meeting with counsel.	2.70
04/19/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: moot argument; draft questions for panel at moot court tomorrow; multiple correspondence re: same; meet with D. Hallward-Driemeier, T. Brown and S. Minter, J. Scott Hickman and Phillip F. Cramer to discuss case and mock argument.	2.60
04/19/15	J. Scott Hickman	Email D. Canon and S. Minter re: oral argument; prepare for moot.	1.70
04/20/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Participate in moot; help prepare for moot; meetings after moot.	7.30

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
04/20/15	William L. Harbison	Meet with counsel and attend moot court.	8.00
04/20/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: meeting and mock arguments; prepare for mock argument; attend mock argument.	5.40
04/20/15	J. Scott Hickman	Meet with D. Hallward-Driemeier, et al.; prepare for and attend moot.	8.00
04/21/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Prepare for next moots; emails with counsel; help with preparation for oral argument.	4.60
04/21/15	William L. Harbison	Meet with counsel; telephone conference with Doug.	1.00
04/21/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: mock argument review and trip for arguments; work on documents to bring to argument; review articles on case; correspondence re: mock arguments and argument; prepare documents for mock arguments.	1.90
04/21/15	J. Scott Hickman	Email with D. Canon; internal conferences re: logistics for D.C. stay and SCOTUS preparation; emails with external co-counsel re: same.	3.00
04/22/15	J. Scott Hickman	Travel to Washington, D.C.; prepare for and attend mock argument.	13.00
04/22/15	William L. Harbison	Moot court in Washington, D.C.	10.00
04/22/15	John L. Farringer	Travel to Washington, D.C.; prepare for moot argument; moot argument at Howard School; conference with all attorneys re: moot and strategy.	13.00
04/22/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Travel to DC; moot court; meetings re: moot court.	13.00
04/23/15	J. Scott Hickman	Meetings held with D. Hallward-Driemeier, et al. re: preparation for oral argument; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer conference.	6.60
04/23/15	William L. Harbison	Meet with counsel; emails.	1.50
04/23/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: case and strategy on several issues.	0.50
04/23/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Prepare for hearing; conference with counsel.	1.50
04/24/15	J. Scott Hickman	Attend Georgetown moot and numerous emails/telephone conferences re: preparation for oral argument; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer conference.	10.50
04/24/15	William L. Harbison	Moot court at Georgetown; meet with counsel.	8.00

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
04/24/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference call re: meetings yesterday, argument introduction and strategy; review correspondence.	0.40
04/24/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Meetings with counsel; prepare for oral argument; attend moot court.	10.80
04/25/15	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with T. Brown, D. Hallward-Driemeier and team re: oral argument and legal research re: issues identified at Georgetown moot.	1.80
04/25/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel; help with argument prep.	1.60
04/26/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel; help with argument prep; telephone conference with counsel; work on Q&A; work on material for oral argument.	3.70
04/26/15	J. Scott Hickman	Meet with D. Hallward-Driemeier, T. Brown and S. Minter re: oral argument; review and revise Q&A for argument; emails with counsel from other teams regarding logistics for Tuesday's argument.	5.80
04/26/15	John L. Farringer	Review articles; multiple correspondence re: same, logistics for argument and media; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: argument refinements, introduction and meetings.	2.10
04/27/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Meetings re: oral argument; emails re: same; emails re: answers. 04/27/15 William L. Harbison Meet with counsel; emails.	4.30
04/27/15	William L. Harbison	Meet with counsel; emails.	1.40
04/27/15	John L. Farringer	Work on Supreme Court entry and logistics; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference; attend group meeting; review motion to recuse and correspondence re: same.	0.50
04/27/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review video of Nashville moot; transcribe answer re: timing of right; email M. Buanto re: same; emails with D. Hallward-Driemeier and co-counsel.	1.70
04/28/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Travel to/from courthouse; attend oral argument; post-argument meetings and debriefings.	7.70
04/28/15	J. Scott Hickman	Prepare for and attend oral argument.	7.70
04/28/15	William L. Harbison	Attend Supreme Court hearing and meet with counsel and clients.	8.00
04/28/15	John L. Farringer	Attend oral argument; meetings re: same.	7.80
04/29/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel; travel back from DC.	4.30
04/29/15	J. Scott Hickman	Travel from DC to Nashville.	4.50

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
04/29/15	William L. Harbison	Travel from Washington, D.C. to Nashville, TN.	4.50
04/29/15	John L. Farringer	Travel from Washington, D.C. to Nashville; review articles on argument.	4.50
04/30/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Meetings re: next steps; review emails and articles including quotes from Tennessee re: next steps.	0.90
05/01/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Follow up emails re: argument.	0.30
05/04/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: follow-up.	0.20
05/12/15	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with co-counsel re: comments by the Lt. Governor regarding Tennessee intentions following SCOTUS opinion.	0.40
05/13/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter and legal research re: options following SCOTUS opinion.	1.40
05/14/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails re: next steps and addressing comments that State will refuse to follow SIDTUS opinion.	0.30
05/15/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails.	0.30
05/15/15	J. Scott Hickman	Research re: potential post-ruling motions; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer re: same; conference with S. Rychlak re: research on Loving v. Virginia; emails with co-counsel re: post-opinion issues.	2.40
05/15/15	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: strategy post-decision and making judgment final.	0.20
05/15/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: next steps, permanent injunctions and motion practice.	0.50
05/18/15	William L. Harbison	Conference call with counsel; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference.	1.00
05/18/15	J. Scott Hickman	Conference call with co-counsel re: potential motions following issue of opinion by SCOTUS; legal research re: same; review motions made in similar cases.	2.20
05/18/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: call, motion for final order strategy and article.	0.30
05/18/15	Susanna Rychlak	TN reaction to Loving v. Virginia research.	1.90
05/18/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference ; emails re: call and next steps.	0.30
05/19/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: motion practice; conference re: same.	0.40
05/19/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review memo from S. Rychlak re: Tennessee actions after Loving v. Virginia; emails with co-counsel re: same.	0.30

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
05/19/15	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: call yesterday and strategy on motion.	0.20
05/19/15	Susanna Rychlak	Enforcement of Loving v. Virginia research.	1.10
05/20/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter; telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier re: potential post-opinion motions; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference re: same; legal research re: timing of potential motions.	1.30
05/20/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: post-judgment motions and related issues.	1.00
05/21/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conferences; emails with J. Scott Hickman; work on strategy and next steps/filings.	0.60
05/21/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter; emails with co-counsel and internal conferences re: potential post-opinion motions.	0.80
05/22/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails and conference re: next steps.	0.20
05/28/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel.	0.10
05/28/15	Susanna Rychlak	piling files on implementation of Loving vs. Virginia. Com	0.60
05/29/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel.	0.10
05/29/15	Susanna Rychlak	Correspondence outlining research.	0.60
06/01/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: enforcement of Supreme Court ruling.	0.20
06/01/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review S. Rychlak memo re: implementation; emails with co-counsel re: same	0.30
06/04/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Email with J. Scott Hickman and S. Minter	0.10
06/08/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails with counsel.	0.20
06/08/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter re: post-opinion motions, et al.	0.80
06/09/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel.	0.20
06/09/15	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with S. Minter and D. Hallward-Driemeier re: preparation for announcement of decision; telephone conference with S. Minter.	1.00
06/10/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Multiple emails re: order and next steps.	0.20
06/10/15	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with co-counsel re: announcement of opinion and potential motions; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference re: same.	0.60
06/11/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: Supreme Court and forthcoming opinion.	0.20
06/11/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter and emails with co-counsel re: forthcoming	1.20

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
		opinion announcement and potential post-opinion motions.	
06/12/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel.	0.20
06/12/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: decision timing.	0.20
06/15/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: recent Supreme Court opinion.	0.20
06/16/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel.	0.10
06/16/15	John L. Farringer	Review analysis on forthcoming opinion; correspondence re: same and timing.	0.30
06/17/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: opinion dates.	0.30
06/18/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails and conference with counsel re: decisions and statements from AG and State whether they will follow Supreme Court decision.	0.20
06/21/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails with counsel re: state of Tennessee comments on whether it will abide by Supreme Court ruling.	0.10
06/21/15	John L. Farringer	Review multiple articles and correspondence re: Tennessee Attorney General and Governor on plans after decision.	0.40
06/22/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: opinions and articles re: next steps.	0.30
06/23/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: decision prospects and potential next steps.	0.30
06/24/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: next steps and potential outcomes.	0.30
06/24/15	William L. Harbison	Review emails; meet with counsel.	2.50
06/25/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails and conferences re: potential opinion and planning for next steps.	0.30
06/26/15	William L. Harbison	Review court opinion; meet with counsel.	6.00
06/26/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review opinion; meetings re: next steps; emails with counsel re: same; review and monitor AG's decision and defendants' statements.	2.70
06/26/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review opinion; telephone conferences with co-counsel re: same.	4.00
06/26/15	John L. Farringer	Review Supreme Court opinion; multiple correspondence and conference calls re: same; review reports on decision; multiple correspondence re: opinion; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: call with Attorney General's office; correspondence re: same.	3.10
06/27/15	William L. Harbison	Review opinion.	1.50
06/28/15	William L. Harbison	Review opinion.	1.00
06/29/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Conference re: fee petition; emails re: enforcement of opinion.	0.30
06/29/15	William L. Harbison	Review opinion dissents; William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re:	3.00

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
		filing to be made post-opinion; telephone conference with S. Minter; emails with counsel.	
06/29/15	John L. Farringer	Review correspondence; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: fee application.	0.30
06/29/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone calls and conferences with co-counsel re: implementation issues and potential fee petition/entry of final order issues; begin legal research re: fee petition.	2.20
06/30/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on final judgment; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; emails re: compliance around the state; work on fee petition issues.	0.80
06/30/15	William L. Harbison	Review opinion; telephone conference with counsel re: next steps.	1.00
06/30/15	John L. Farringer	Review and edit draft order for district court; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer correspondence re: same.	0.40
06/30/15	J. Scott Hickman	Draft final order/injunction; legal research re: fee petition; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference re: final order draft.	3.10
07/01/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on proposed final order; conference re: fee petition; monitor compliance with SCOTUS decision.	1.40
07/01/15	John L. Farringer	Work on proposed order for district court; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same and fee application; review order; conference with other counsel re: fee application.	0.90
07/01/15	J. Scott Hickman	Legal research re: fee petition; emails with A. Rubinfeld; conference re: draft order; telephone conference with S. Minter re: draft order; telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier and S. Minter re: implementation issues.	5.00
07/02/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on final order; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same and fee petition materials.	0.80
07/02/15	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with S. Minter re: draft final order; review revisions to same; emails with all co-counsel re: draft final order; telephone conference with T. Brown re: fee petition issues.	1.80
07/02/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: Ropes & Gray fees and affidavits supporting fee application; legal	0.40

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
		research re: fee application; correspondence re: same; review draft trial order.	
07/03/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: final order.	0.20
07/03/15	John L. Farringer	Review articles and multiple correspondence re: clerks refusing to issue licenses and strategy re: same; multiple correspondence re: draft order for district court.	0.40
07/04/15	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with M. Holland re: draft order.	0.40
07/06/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: order.	0.10
07/06/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: order.	0.30
07/06/15	J. Scott Hickman	Legal research re: fee petition; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: final order; outline potential memorandum in support of fee petition and review similar petitions; telephone conference with D. Canon re: Kentucky fee petition and related issues.	4.70
07/06/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: proposed order; review correspondence and article on effect of ruling.	0.30
07/07/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; email; review draft order.	1.00
07/07/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: application for fees strategy; legal research re: same; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: same and supporting affidavits; work on proposed order and correspondence with Tennessee Attorney General re: same.	0.80
07/07/15	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with D. Canon, et. al. re: fee petitions; telephone conference with M. Campbell re: final order and email M. Campbell re: same; review previous orders in Kentucky and elsewhere.	1.20
07/08/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on fee petition and final order.	0.90
07/08/15	John L. Farringer	Legal research for fee application; correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; review report on couples denied licenses and correspondence re: same.	0.70
07/08/15	J. Scott Hickman	Legal research re: fee petition; review R. Lambert email re: fee petition; emails with S. Minter and C. Stoll re: potential deadlines.	3.40
07/09/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on fee petition and next steps.	1.40
07/09/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: fee application strategy.	0.20

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
07/09/15	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference re: fee petition and related issues; telephone conference with T. Brown re: fee petition and SCOTUS costs; email D. Canon re: fee petition; review appellate rules re: costs.	1.90
07/13/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: order; emails re: compliance.	0.30
07/13/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: enforcement question with state employee and health benefits; correspondence re: effective date of decision; legal research re: both issues; multiple correspondence with team re: analysis.	1.00
07/13/15	J. Scott Hickman	Numerous emails re: implementation issues; telephone conference with M. Campbell re: status of proposed order; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference re: same; telephone conference with A. Rubinfeld re: implementation issues.	1.50
07/14/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: order and compliance.	0.20
07/14/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence with co-counsel re: implementation issue and attorney general opinion.	0.10
07/15/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: order and compliance.	0.20
07/17/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: order.	0.20
07/17/15	John L. Farringer	Review revised order from state; correspondence re: same; review articles on fee awards analysis; correspondence re: same.	0.40
07/19/15	John L. Farringer	Review state's edits to order; multiple correspondence re: state's edits to order and strategy; review complaint; correspondence re: same; multiple correspondence re: state providing benefits under opinion to same sex parties.	0.60
07/20/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review edits from State re: proposed order.	0.10
07/20/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: order; review edits to order; correspondence re: same.	0.20
07/21/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Meeting re: order; emails re: same.	1.00
07/21/15	William L. Harbison	Meet with counsel re: final order; telephone conference with Martin and Hallward-Driemeier re: same; review draft order.	3.60
07/21/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with D. Canon and J. Branch re: fee petitions; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer conference to discuss proposed order; telephone conference	3.80

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
07/21/15	John L. Farringer	with S. Minter re: same; telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier re: same; emails with M. Campbell re: same; review draft proposed by AG's office; reconstruct AG's proposed order in Word version for editing; emails with M. Campbell re: same; revise proposed order; emails with co-counsel re: edits to order and telephone conference with S. Minter re: same. Review correspondence re: order; compare competing orders; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same; correspondence re: order and fee petition; review proposed compromise order; correspondence re: same.	1.30
07/22/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: revisions to order.	0.10
07/22/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; telephone conference with M. Campbell; emails re: final order.	1.40
07/22/15	J. Scott Hickman	Revise order; emails with S. Minter and other co-counsel re: same; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference and telephone conference with M. Campbell.	1.40
07/22/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: new version of order and strategy; review revised order; correspondence re: call with Attorney General's Office.	0.40
07/23/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: final order; review emails re: motion for time to file fee application.	0.50
07/23/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: Attorney General's communication and draft motion on fees.	0.20
07/23/15	J. Scott Hickman	Draft motion to set time for filing of fee petition; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference; telephone conference with M. Campbell; email co-counsel; email A. Rieger.	1.40
07/24/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: motion to file today and Attorney General's edit; multiple correspondence re: same; review filed motion.	0.20
07/24/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with A. Rieger; file motion; emails with co-counsel re: motion, amendments to motion and status of possible agreed order.	1.20
07/26/15	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with co-counsel re: fee petition filed in other similar cases.	0.30

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
07/27/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Conference and emails re: fee petition.	0.20
07/27/15	John L. Farringer	Review Michigan fee application; correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same and our application; review order on motion to set fee schedule; correspondence re: same.	0.50
07/27/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review Michigan fee application; internal conferences and emails with co-counsel re: same; emails with D. Canon.	1.60
07/28/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails and conference re: fee petition and order.	0.30
07/28/15	William L. Harbison	Review final order; emails.	0.30
07/28/15	John L. Farringer	Review final judgment and cost assessment; correspondence re: same and fee application; review articles re: R. Womick instructing clerk to ignore case; correspondence re: same.	0.40
07/29/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on fee petition; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: lack of response from state re: order.	0.40
07/29/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier and S. Minter re: fee petition/status of potential agreed order.	0.60
07/30/15	John L. Farringer	Review AG's edits to order; multiple correspondence re: same.	0.30
07/30/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review proposed changes to final order from AG's office; numerous emails with co-counsel re: same and need to file separate proposed orders.	0.80
07/31/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: State's response to proposed order.	0.10
07/31/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: competing final orders and strategy; correspondence re: same.	0.30
07/31/15	J. Scott Hickman	Emails re: proposed final order; internal conferences re: same.	0.30
08/03/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Revise motion; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: order.	0.50
08/03/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: final order and motion for final order; work on draft motion; correspondence re: same.	0.40
08/03/15	J. Scott Hickman	Conferences re: proposed final order; draft motion to enter proposed final order; telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier and S. Minter re: status of order and related matters; internal conferences re: same.	2.40
08/04/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference re: final order; emails re: same.	0.20

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
08/04/15	John L. Farringer	Review court of appeals citing Obergefell; correspondence re: same; multiple correspondence re: motion for final order, edits and strategy.	0.50
08/04/15	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference re: final order; revise/draft motion for entry of final order; emails with co-counsel collecting comments on draft.	2.60
08/05/15	John L. Farringer	Multiple correspondence re: proposed order and filing; internal conference re: same.	0.20
08/05/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with R. Lambert re: motion/final order; emails with other counsel re: same.	0.40
08/06/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman re: find order; telephone conference with M. Campbell re: same.	0.50
08/06/15	J. Scott Hickman	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference; telephone conference with M. Campbell; emails with co-counsel re: motion for entry of final order.	0.80
08/07/15	John L. Farringer	Final review of motion for final order; work on filing same.	0.30
08/07/15	J. Scott Hickman	Legal research re: fee petition; emails re: motion; finalize and file same; telephone conference with S. Minter re: status of fee petition and final order.	3.60
08/11/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review AG response to motion to enter order.	0.10
08/11/15	William L. Harbison	Emails re: final order.	0.30
08/11/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: fee application and Ohio opinion on enforcement; review court correspondence re: opposition to proposed final order and state's response; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same and fee application; review response and alternate order filed by state; multiple correspondence re: same.	0.60
08/11/15	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison conference re: fee petition and status; review response filed by AG re: final order.	0.50
08/12/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Meeting re: fee petition; work on fee petition; work on reply.	0.90
08/12/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference re: final order and reply; emails re: same; revise and edit reply.	1.50
08/12/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: response to proposed order and fee application; correspondence re: same; John	2.50

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
08/12/15	J. Scott Hickman	L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference call with D. Hallward-Driemeier and T. Brown; John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: response to proposed order, fee application and supporting affidavits; work on reply in support of motion for entry of order; multiple correspondence re: same and edits. J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference; legal research re: Rule 54(c); draft memo re: final order; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: fee petition and final order; telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier re: same; emails all co-counsel re: draft reply; emails with D. Codell; telephone conference with D. Codell.	5.20
08/13/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails re: reply brief.	0.10
08/13/15	William L. Harbison	William L. Harbison/J. Scott Hickman conference; emails; edit response to AG re: final order.	0.60
08/13/15	John L. Farringer	Review new version of reply; multiple correspondence re: same.	0.40
08/13/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review cases related to fee petition; emails with co-counsel re: reply/entry of final order; finalize and file same.	2.80
08/17/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review orders and mandate from Sixth Circuit.	0.10
08/17/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with M. Holland re: fee application; review Holland fee records; review R&G summaries; internal conference re: fee petition.	1.40
08/18/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review time records for fee petition; J. Scott Hickman/William L. Harbison/Phillip F. Cramer/John L. Farringer email re: status of fee petition; email D. Hallward-Driemeier re: same.	3.20
08/18/15	John L. Farringer	Review order and mandate from 6th Circuit and notice from district court; correspondence re: enforcement cases; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: invoices and fee application.	0.60
08/19/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review exhibits for fee petition.	0.40
08/19/15	John L. Farringer	Work on fee application issues; J. Scott Hickman/John L. Farringer conference re: same and confidentiality issue.	0.40
08/20/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with A. Whelan re: fee petition.	0.20

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
08/21/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review time sheets; emails with counsel re: fee petition.	0.20
08/21/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with D. Canon re: fee petition and related issues.	0.50
08/22/15	John L. Farringer	Review time records; correspondence re: fee application.	0.30
08/24/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Review order; work on fee petition materials.	0.80
08/24/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review order/memorandum and emails with co-counsel re: same; emails with A. Rubenfeld; emails with D. Canon re: Kentucky fee petition and review same.	1.20
08/24/15	John L. Farringer	Review Kentucky fee petition; correspondence re: same; review filed order and memorandum; multiple correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same and fee application.	0.50
08/25/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/William L. Harbison conference re: order and memorandum yesterday and strategy on fee application.	0.20
08/25/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with S. Minter.	0.40
08/31/15	J. Scott Hickman	Review state court decision re: subject matter jurisdiction over divorce cases; emails with co-counsel re: same.	0.40
09/02/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on fee petition materials.	2.50
09/02/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: declarations for fee petition; review declarations; multiple correspondence re: fee petition and related issues; work on declarations.	0.70
09/02/15	J. Scott Hickman	Emails with co-counsel re: status of fee petition and research re: recovery of time spend on fee petition.	0.60
09/03/15	J. Scott Hickman	J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: fee petition.	0.30
09/09/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails and conference re: attorney fee petition.	0.20
09/09/15	J. Scott Hickman	Work on memorandum in support of fee petition.	2.20
09/10/15	J. Scott Hickman	Draft/revise fee petition.	2.30
09/11/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Emails and conference re: attorney fee petition.	0.20
09/17/15	J. Scott Hickman	Revise/draft fee petition.	3.20
09/18/15	John L. Farringer	John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: fee application and all counsel time sheets.	0.20
09/18/15	J. Scott Hickman	Revise/draft fee petition.	1.70
09/21/15	J. Scott Hickman	Draft, revise and edit fee petition.	1.80
09/21/15	John L. Farringer	Work on fee petition; correspondence re: same.	1.20

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
09/22/15	J. Scott Hickman	Revise fee petition; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same.	1.30
09/22/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on fee petition; Phillip F. Cramer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	1.60
09/22/15	John L. Farringer	Work on fee application; multiple correspondence re: same; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same and edits.	0.40
09/23/15	J. Scott Hickman	Telephone conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier; telephone conference with A. Rubenfeld; telephone conference with R. Lambert; revise/draft fee petition; John L. Farringer/Phillip F. Cramer/William L. Harbison/John L. Farringer conferences re: same.	4.80
09/23/15	John L. Farringer	Correspondence re: fee application and exhibits; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same; review and edit fee petition.	1.00
09/24/15	J. Scott Hickman	Revise fee petition; J. Scott Hickman/Phillip F. Cramer conference re: same.	0.90
09/24/15	Phillip F. Cramer	Work on fee petition; emails with J. Scott Hickman re: same.	0.60
09/24/15	John L. Farringer	Work on fee petition; correspondence re: same; review table of all fees; correspondence with team re: same.	0.40
09/25/15	John L. Farringer	Legal research on timesheets for fee petition; John L. Farringer/J. Scott Hickman conference re: same.	0.20
			1618.05